From: Rupali Pol <rupali.pol@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: Wednesday, February 28, 2024 6:26 PM

To: Ameet Koomar <Ameet.Koomar@adani.com>; Parag Pandey <parag.pandey@travelfoodservices.com>; Anil Nayak <anil.nayak@travelfoodservices.com>; Ajit Singh
<ajit.singh@semolinakitchens.com>

Subject: FW: PASS SECTION OUTSTANDING PAYMENT DEATILS

*CAUTION: This mail has originated from outside Adani. Please exercise caution with links and attachments.*

Dear Ameet,

As discussed, request you to approve the pass section (AEP & Web passes ) amount for payment.
@Parag Pandey

Request you to release the payment total pending amount:-82800/-

;ﬁ' Agency Name Receipt Spend Amount
01 [ SEMOLINA KITCHENS PVT LTD 63,675 146,475 (82,800)

All Payment to be made into the following bank account.

Beneficiary Name : Ahmedabad International Airport Limited
Bank Name: ICICI BANK LTD

Bank Address: CSM MUMBAI

Virtual Bank Account Number is: AIALAMD13797.

[FSC Code: ICIC0000104

Thanks

Rupali

From: Ajit Singh <ajit.singh@semolinakitchens.com>
Sent: Wednesday, February 28, 2024 5:06 PM

To: Rupali Pol <rupali.pol@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: Fwd: PASS SECTION OUTSTANDING PAYMENT DEATILS

Dear ma'am,



