Mastercreation TFS

From: Maya Rajguru

Sent: 18 January 2024 12:28

To: Mastercreation TFS

Cc: Anil Nayak; Parag Pandey

Subject: FW: FW: Required Cancel Cheque for Bank Details Updation
Attachments: SBI CHEQUE.pdf

Dear Omkar,

Please update Bank details and confirm.

Vendor No. | Description Entity
V0000079 | EN KOYARA FOODS | TFSCPL

Regards,

Maya Rajguru

From: Sulaiman T.C. <enkoyarafoods@gmail.com>

Sent: 18 January 2024 09:51

To: Vijayakumar S <vijayakumar.s@k-corp.in>

Cc: Chennai Purchase <chennai.purchase@travelfoodservices.com>; Chennai Finance
<chennai.finance@travelfoodservices.com>; Kumar V <kumar.v@k-corp.in>; Selvakumar M <selvakumar.m@k-
corp.in>; Maya Rajguru <maya.rajguru@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: Re: FW: Required Cancel Cheque for Bank Details Updation

You don't often get email from enkoyarafoods@gmail.com. Learn why this is important

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize
the sender and know the content is safe.

PFA

On Tue, 16 Jan 2024 at 17:28, Vijayakumar S <vijayakumar.s@k-corp.in> wrote:

Dear Sir,

Reference to trial mail, kindly share the cancelled chgq.

Regards

Vijay

From: Maya Rajguru <maya.rajguru@travelfoodservices.com>
Sent: 16 January 2024 17:26




To: Chennai Finance <chennai.finance@travelfoodservices.com>; Vijayakumar S <vijayakumar.s@Xk-
corp.in>

Cc: Anil Nayak <anil.nayak@travelfoodservices.com>; Parag Pandey
<parag.pandey@travelfoodservices.com>; Anuj Dubey <anuj.dubey@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: Required Cancel Cheque for Bank Details Updation

Importance: High

Dear Both,

Please arrange cancelled cheque for the below mentioned vendors as we need to update Bank details in
vendor master.

Vendor No. | Description Entity

V0000079 | EN KOYARA FOODS TFSCPL
V0000208 | Fresh & Honest Cafe Limited | TFSCPL
V0000264 | SRT Industries TFSCPL

V0000321 | D.Mohammed Abdul Rasheed | TFSCPL
V0000949 | Infinite inventory management | TFSCPL

Regards,

Maya Rajguru

For En Koyara Foods

Mobile No.1 : 98844 83778
Mobile No.2 : 72000 83778



