Mastercreation TFS

From: Swapnil Sutar <swapnil.sutar@k-corp.in>
Sent: 24 October 2024 10:35

To: Mastercreation TFS

Cc: Sandeep Bhat K-Corp; Abdul Rehman
Subject: FW: Change in bank acc lazarus industries
Attachments: DOC-20240318-WA0004

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Omkar,

Request to you please update bank account no of the Lazarus industries.

1 Active Review | InActive | Resend Detail | Print 12 - Dec - 2023 Rv232417646 VDDO493
2 Active Review | InActive | Resend Detail | Print 12 - Dec - 2023 Rv2iz414734 | YVODOZ944
3 Active Review | InActive | Resend Detail | Print 12 - Dec - 2023 Rv232410374 VDDOOSTA

Thanks & Regards,

Swapnil Sutar
H | & +919987022136
Travel Food Services Pvt. Limited.

From: Lazarus Industries <lazarusind@gmail.com>
Sent: 24 October 2024 09:46

To: Swapnil Sutar <swapnil.sutar@k-corp.in>
Subject: Change in bank acc

Sir.
Greetings from LAZARUS INDUSTRIES

Semolina Kitchens Private Limited
TRAVEL FOOD SERVICES PRIVATE LIMITED

TF5 (RER Works) Private Limited

Lazarus Industries

Lazarus Industries

Lazarus Industries

Aaren LazarusilLazarus

Aaren LazarusiLazarus

Aaren LazarusiLazarus

lazarusind@
lazarusindi@

lazarusindi@



We request you to kindly update your records
Our sbi acc has closed and the payment made to SBI would have refunded to your acc
Request you to please update your records with out Deutsche Bank account and process the payment accordingly

Thank you



