Mastercreation TFS

From: Parag Pandey

Sent: 04 October 2024 13:20

To: Anil Nayak; Mastercreation TFS; Maya Rajguru; Invoices TFS; Siddhesh Dolas
Subject: RE: Bank A/c Changes-Super Services Station-BLR

Attachments: 20241004122820.pdf

PLs update in records

From: Anil Nayak <anil.nayak@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: Friday, October 4, 2024 12:38 PM

To: Mastercreation TFS <mastercreation.tfs@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Parag Pandey parag.pandey@travelfoodservices.com; Maya Rajguru <maya.rajguru@travelfoodservices.com>; Invoices TFS <invoices@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: Bank A/c Changes-Super Services Station-BLR

Hi Omkar,

Please find and update new bank details as per letter and cancel Cheque.
Entity: BLR Lounge

Vendor: SUPER SERVICE STATION

Code: VEND0O897

Regards
Anil



