Mastercreation TFS

From: Nimisha Jadhav

Sent: 31 October 2024 12:39

To: Mastercreation TFS

Cc: Shadab Sukri; Binu Balachandran; Mrunal Joshi; Pushpak Shewale; Parag Pandey
Subject: RE: Invoice | Subway _ Shop No 17 (T1 Node L5-5.3-049)

Dear Omkar,
Kindly active below vendor on priority to upload invoice .

Vendor Email Imraankhan0786@gmail.com

Vendor Phone No. 9250452955

SUPPLIER
SUPPLIER CODE- HAME OF
:U“ sg::TLL'I';“ ACTION “EG';;{T:T'G” CODE- HAVISION ENTITY NAME HAME OF SUPPLIER CONTACT SUPPLIER EMAIL ED"_’I
: SAFAL (ENTITY PERSON
WISE)
1 Inactive Review | Active | Resend Detall | Print |~ 12-Dec-2023 | RV232415501 | VOIOOT45 Travel Food Services Private Limited - TFSKPL  Imran Nazir Ahmad Architect  Imran Imraankhand7as@gmall.com
2 Disabled  Rsview | inActive | Resend Detall | Print 12-Dec-2023  RYZ32413365  VODO2174 TRAVEL FOOD SERVICES PRIVATE LIMITED imiran Nazir Ahmad Architect  Imran Imraankhand7as@gmall.com

Thanks & Regards,
Nimisha Jadhav.

From: Nimisha Jadhav

Sent: 31 October 2024 11:58

To: Mrunal Joshi <mrunal.joshi@k-corp.in>; Pushpak Shewale <pushpak.shewale@k-corp.in>

Cc: Shadab Sukri <shadab.sukri@travelfoodservices.com>; Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@travelfoodservices.com>; Imran Khan <imraankhan0786@gmail.com>;
Mastercreation TFS <mastercreation.tfs@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: RE: Invoice | Subway _ Shop No 17 (T1 Node L5-5.3-049)

Dear Team,



Kindly support to arrange document form vendor as vendor showing disable in Safal

Thanks & Regards,
Nimisha Jadhav.

From: Imran Khan <imraankhan0786@gmail.com>

Sent: 31 October 2024 11:28

To: Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Shadab Sukri <shadab.sukri@travelfoodservices.com>; Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: Re: Invoice | Subway _ Shop No 17 (T1 Node L5-5.3-049)

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Nimisha,

Please find attached the invoice with changed address.
Kindly release payment. Work already completed

Thank you

INAA

Imran Nazir Ahmad Architect

New Delhi - 110080, India

Mobile: +91 (0) 9250452955

Email ID: imraankhan0786@gmail.com

On Sat, 5 Oct 2024 at 19:14, Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav(@travelfoodservices.com> wrote:

Dear Sir,

Kindly share revised invoice with below billing address as per attached PO.



Outlet name DEL Subway

TRAVEL FOOD SERVICES PRIVATE LIMITED
RP No 1224, Khasra No 637, G.F Village,
Rangpuri, New Delhi, Delhi,

DELH]I, India 110037

India

Invoice Location

TRAVEL FOOD SERVICES PRIVATE LIMITED
Delhi

New Terminal 1, Indira Gandhi International Airport,
Domestic Departure Sha, Mehram Nagar, New Delhi, New
Delhi, Delhi, 110037

GSTIN No : 07TAADCB2762L2ZJ

Thanks & Regards,

Nimisha Jadhav.



From: Imran Khan <imraankhan0786@gmail.com>

Sent: 05 October 2024 11:43

To: Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Shadab Sukri <shadab.sukri@travelfoodservices.com>; Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: Re: Invoice | Subway _ Shop No 17 (T1 Node L5-5.3-049)

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Hi Nimisha,

Awaiting revert on payment release.

Thanks & Regards

INAA

Imran Nazir Ahmad Architect

New Delhi - 110080, India

Mobile: +91 (0) 9250452955

Email ID: imraankhan0786@gmail.com

On Wed, 25 Sept 2024 at 12:12, Imran Khan <imraankhan0786(@gmail.com> wrote:
4



Hi Nimisha,

As discussed, Please find attached the invoice.

Request for payment release

Thanks

Imran

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Imran Khan <imraankhan0786(@gmail.com>

Date: Sun, 14 Jul, 2024, 2:07 pm

Subject: Re: Invoice | Subway  Shop No 17 (T1 Node L5-5.3-049)

To: Shadab Sukri <shadab.sukri@travelfoodservices.com>, Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>

Cc: Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>, Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>, Ajit Singh <ajit.singh@travelfoodservices.com>,
Stephen P <stephen.p@k-corp.in>, Sonali Dhadve <Sonali.dhadve@k-corp.in>, Jogeswar Sahu <jogeswar.sahu@travelfoodservices.com>

Dear Shadab,

As discussed, Please find attached the invoice to release the payment.

Thanks



Imran

INAA

Imran Nazir Ahmad Architect

New Delhi - 110080, India

Mobile: +91 (0) 9250452955

Email ID: imraankhan0786@gmail.com

On Sat, 16 Dec 2023 at 14:23, Jogeswar Sahu <jogeswar.sahu@travelfoodservices.com> wrote:

Dear sir,

Please see approved work order.

Thanks & Regards,

Jogeswar Sahu

+91 9082949517



