Mastercreation TFS

From: Kolkata Purchase <kolkata.purchase@k-corp.in>

Sent: 07 October 2024 16:48

To: Anil Nayak; Mastercreation TFS; Jayesh Deherkar; Siddhesh Dolas
Cc: Parag Pandey; Anuj Dubey; Priyoranjan Thoi

Subject: Fw: Request for change in Bank Details

Attachments: cancelled chequelOB.pdf

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Team,
Please go through the trail mail and do the needful.

Regards,

Avijit Banerjee

7439573731

Purchase

Travel Food Services Kolkata Pvt. Ltd.

From: lalguffa international <lalguffainternational@gmail.com>

Sent: Friday, October 4, 2024 10:46 AM

To: Priyoranjan Thoi <priyoranjan.thoi@k-corp.in>; Kolkata Purchase <kolkata.purchase@k-corp.in>
Subject: Request for change in Bank Details

Dear Sir,
Kindly note that the Bank details of Lal Guffa International has been changed taos follows:
ACCOUNT NAME:LAL GUFFA INTERNATIONAL.

ACCOUNT NUMBER:0509020000210868
BANK NAME:INDIAN OVERSEAS BANK.



BRANCH:GOLPARK.
KOLKATA-700029.
IFSC:IOBA0000509.

PFA a copy of the cancelled cheque for your records.
Best Regards

For lal guffa international

Biswanath Bhattacharya



