Mastercreation TFS

From: Invoices TFS

Sent: 06 June 2024 18:41

To: Mastercreation TFS

Cc: Bharat Gondhale; Parag Pandey; Ankit Jain

Subject: Vendor Activate in SAFAL : Shambhu Gupta & Company
Importance: High

Omkar,

Please activate vendor code for ALL Entity in SAFAL

Contact Person Name : Ankit Jain
Email ID : ankit@casgc.in
Contact Person Name : 022- 40214937

From: Bharat Gondhale <bharat.gondhale@travelfoodservices.com>
Sent: 30 May 2024 12:59

To: Invoices TFS <invoices@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Anuj Dubey <anuj.dubey@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: Shambhu Gupta - Pending Invoices

Hi,
Attached company wise invoices of Shambhu Gupta’s invoice related to Foreign Remittances. Kindly do the needful.
Regards

Bharat Gondhale
Finance



