Mastercreation TFS

From: Herambraj Sonawane <mumbai.purchase1@k-corp.in>

Sent: 26 April 2024 11:21

To: Mastercreation TFS

Subject: FW: Po - 0365 13 Jun 23- M365 Licenses & Migration Services

Attachments: Filled Vendor Registration Form_K Hospitality_Version0.3_Effective from 10.12.2022 xlsx; Cancelled Cheque - Yes Bank.pdf; COI TCPL.pdf;

Delhi GST Certificate .pdf; Team PAN No .pdf

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

From: Herambraj Sonawane

Sent: Friday, April 19, 2024 5:14 PM

To: Mastercreation TFS <mastercreation.tfs@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>; Asad Shamsi <asad.shamsi@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: FW: Po - 0365 13 Jun 23- M365 Licenses & Migration Services

Dear Omkar
Kindly update email id in below entity .

TFSPL-TFSCPL-TFSKPL-MALS-BLSPL —TFSR&R —SKPL

Name - Shipra Sarabhai , Email id- shipra.sarabhai@teamcomputers.com -

Contact number - 8826006221 - VENDOR NAME - TEAM COMPUTER

Thanks & Regards
Heramb

9702415737



From: Tripti Jain <tripti.jain@teamcomputers.com>

Sent: Wednesday, June 21, 2023 3:32 PM

To: Asad Shamsi <asad.shamsi@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Nikhil Bhushan <nikhil.bhushan@travelfoodservices.com>; Brayl Dias <brayl.dias@k-corp.in>; Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>; Kamal Saraf
<kamal.saraf @k-corp.in>; Shipra Sarabhai <shipra.sarabhai@teamcomputers.com>; Herambraj Sonawane <mumbai.purchasel@k-corp.in>

Subject: Re: Po - 0365 13 Jun 23- M365 Licenses & Migration Services

Hi Asad,

Enclosed please find VRF along with the required documents.

Thanks & Regards!
te Tripti Jain

COMPUTERS

Mobile: (+91) 9310183723

On Tue, Jun 20, 2023 at 6:47 PM Asad Shamsi <asad.shamsi@travelfoodservices.com> wrote:

Caution! This message was sent from outside your organization.

Dear Tripti,

Here are additional 6 PO’s for 0365 Migration attached.
In all 8 PO’s are shared out of 11 for Migration Charges.

Request you to raise the PI’s against it ASAP.



Also note there is VRF forms attached, please provide your details and send us back.

Regards

Asad Shamsi

From: Tripti Jain <tripti.jain@teamcomputers.com>

Sent: 20 June 2023 16:59

To: Asad Shamsi <asad.shamsi@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Nikhil Bhushan <nikhil.bhushan@travelfoodservices.com>; Brayl Dias <brayl.dias@k-corp.in>; Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>; Kamal Saraf
<kamal.saraf @k-corp.in>; Shipra Sarabhai <shipra.sarabhai@teamcomputers.com>; Herambraj Sonawane <mumbai.purchasel@k-corp.in>

Subject: Re: Po - 0365 13 Jun 23- M365 Licenses & Migration Services

Hi Asad,

There was a typo error in PI 11, please consider the attached one as correct, rest are ok

Thanks & Regards!

te Tripti Jain
COMPUTERS

Mobile: (+91) 9310183723



On Tue, Jun 20, 2023 at 4:53 PM Tripti Jain <tripti.jain@teamcomputers.com> wrote:

Hi Asad

Please find all 13 Proforma attached, all the changes are made, kindly check & process them for the payment.

Do refer to the tenant wise details for all details

https://docs.google.com/spreadsheets/d/13KLRc XvygwWhDO0O EHeMn6bKcN10OP5a6SOry 4xMOFU/edit#gid=0

Thanks & Regards!

te Tripti Jain

COMPUTERS
Mobile: (+91) 9310183723

On Mon, Jun 19, 2023 at 8:04 PM Asad Shamsi <asad.shamsi@travelfoodservices.com> wrote:




Caution! This message was sent from outside your organization.

Dear Tripti,

Here are below additions / changes as mentioned below.

e Please raise new Pl against revised PO of K-Corp Charitable without GSTIN — This company does not have GSTIN whereas earlier by mistake GSTIN no was shared.
e Please refer to the attached PO for Global Kitchen Bangalore and raise new Pl against it, count of license remains same.

e Attached is the PO for licenses for Irish House BKC i.e. “GLOBAL FRANCHISE HOSPITALITY LLP”

e Attached is the PO for licenses for Irish House Belgaum i.e. “GOGTE INFRASTRUCTURE DEVELOPMENT CORPORATION LLP”

e Please note the correct GSTIN for Think food Licenses PO to raise new Pl against it.

e Attached is revised PO of Irish Mumbai Licenses, amend the previous order and raise revised PI.

e Attached PO for Global Kitchen Guwahati.

Please do the needful, do let me know for any queries.

P.S: Note the details mentioned in 0365 Tenant Details 2 and 3 in attachments.



Asad Shamsi

Manager —IT

+91 9930909463

Travel Food Services Pvt. Ltd.

Shiv Sagar Estate, A-Block, 1st Floor,
Dr. Annie Besant Road, Worli,

Mumbai-400018.

Trarved Focedl Sevit,

https://www.k-hospitality.com/

CELEBRATING
Creating memories and inspiring
happiness through food, since 1972

YEARS

[rrrrey, infa . B jlg  wasuenss



From: Tripti Jain <tripti.jain@teamcomputers.com>

Sent: 16 June 2023 18:06

To: Herambraj Sonawane <mumbai.purchasel@k-corp.in>

Cc: Nikhil Bhushan <nikhil.bhushan@travelfoodservices.com>; Brayl Dias <brayl.dias@k-corp.in>; Asad Shamsi <asad.shamsi@travelfoodservices.com>; Lovejot Sekhon

<lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>; Kamal Saraf <kamal.saraf @k-corp.in>; Shipra Sarabhai <shipra.sarabhai@teamcomputers.com>
Subject: Re: Po - 0365 13 Jun 23- M365 Licenses & Migration Services

Hi Team,

Enclosed please find PIs against all the 6 POs shared for further processing.

Thanks & Regards!

te Tripti Jain

COMPUTERS

Mobile: (+91) 9310183723

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Herambraj Sonawane <mumbai.purchasel@k-corp.in>
Date: Fri, 16 Jun 2023 at 1:37 PM

Subject: Po - 0365 13 Jun 23- M365 Licenses & Migration Services




To: shipra.sarabhai@teamcomputers.com <shipra.sarabhai@teamcomputers.com>
Cc: Nikhil Bhushan <nikhil.bhushan@travelfoodservices.com>, Brayl Dias <brayl.dias@k-corp.in>, Asad Shamsi
<asad.shamsi@travelfoodservices.com>, Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>, Kamal Saraf <kamal.saraf(@k-corp.in>

Caution! This message was sent from outside your organization.

Dear Partner

Kindly find attach PO And please acknowledge .

Thanks & Regards

Heramb

9702415737

Thanks & Regards,
Shipra Sarabhai | Enterprise Client Partner

Team Digital Engineering



+91-8826006221/8448384040

Team Computers Pvt. Ltd. | www.teamcomputers.com

team

COMPUTERS




