Mastercreation TFS

From:
Sent:
To:

Cc:
Subject:

Dear Master Creation team,

Dheeraj Yadav

03 December 2024 18:00

Mastercreation TFS

TFEPL Accounts; Kaushik Kumar Sharma; Swapnil Sutar; Sandeep Bhat K-Corp; Support Safal
Re: E-Sourcing : K Hospitality Corp : Supplier Registration Log In Details

As we discussed, kindly active supplier "Top Line FOOD EQUIPMENT LLP" under entity TFS Highway.

Supplier contact person name : Akhilesh
Supplier contact number : 9873239871
Supplier email : accounts@tfepl.com
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thanks,

top line



Dheeraj Yadav
Senior Manager Projects

Travel Food Services
Business Plus,

12th Floor, Tower-A,
Vatika Mindscapes,
NH-2, Mathura Road,
Sector-27D, Faridabad,
Haryana - 121003
8920837882

From: Dheeraj Yadav <dheeraj.yadav@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: 03 December 2024 16:55

To: Support Safal <support.safal@k-corp.in>

Cc: TFEPL Accounts <accounts@tfepl.com>; Sandeep Bhat K-Corp <sandeep.bhat@k-corp.in>; Swapnil Sutar <swapnil.sutar@travelfoodservices.com>; Mastercreation TFS
<mastercreation.tfs@travelfoodservices.com>; Kaushik Kumar Sharma <accounts2 @tfepl.com>

Subject: Re: E-Sourcing : K Hospitality Corp : Supplier Registration Log In Details

Can we do it now!

thanks
Dheeraj Yadav
Senior Manager Projects

Travel Food Services
Business Plus,

12th Floor, Tower-A,
Vatika Mindscapes,
NH-2, Mathura Road,
Sector-27D, Faridabad,
Haryana - 121003
8920837882

From: Support Safal <support.safal@k-corp.in>
Sent: 03 December 2024 15:52
To: Dheeraj Yadav <dheeraj.yadav@travelfoodservices.com>



Cc: TFEPL Accounts <accounts@tfepl.com>; Sandeep Bhat K-Corp <sandeep.bhat@k-corp.in>; Swapnil Sutar <swapnil.sutar@travelfoodservices.com>; Mastercreation TFS
<mastercreation.tfs@travelfoodservices.com>; Kaushik Kumar Sharma <accounts2 @tfepl.com>
Subject: Re: E-Sourcing : K Hospitality Corp : Supplier Registration Log In Details

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Dheeraj ji,
Please suggest your availability to schedule a call to check your concern.

Regards,
Bhagyesh

From: Support Safal <support.safal@k-corp.in>

Sent: 03 December 2024 11:31

To: Dheeraj Yadav <dheeraj.yadav@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: TFEPL Accounts <accounts@tfepl.com>; Sandeep Bhat <sandeep.bhat@k-corp.in>; Swapnil Sutar <swapnil.sutar@travelfoodservices.com>; Mastercreation TFS
<mastercreation.tfs@travelfoodservices.com>; Kaushik Kumar Sharma <accounts2 @tfepl.com>

Subject: Re: E-Sourcing : K Hospitality Corp : Supplier Registration Log In Details

Dear Dheeraj ji,
We will check this and update you.

Regards,
Bhagyesh

From: Dheeraj Yadav <dheeraj.yadav@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: 03 December 2024 11:28

To: Kaushik Kumar Sharma <accounts2 @tfepl.com>; Support Safal <support.safal@k-corp.in>

Cc: TFEPL Accounts <accounts@tfepl.com>; Sandeep Bhat <sandeep.bhat@k-corp.in>; Swapnil Sutar <swapnil.sutar@travelfoodservices.com>; Mastercreation TFS
<mastercreation.tfs@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: Re: E-Sourcing : K Hospitality Corp : Supplier Registration Log In Details

Hi Team Safal,

Kindly have this resolved ASAP.



thanks

Dheeraj Yadav
Senior Manager Projects

Travel Food Services
Business Plus,

12th Floor, Tower-A,
Vatika Mindscapes,
NH-2, Mathura Road,
Sector-27D, Faridabad,
Haryana - 121003
8920837882

From: Kaushik Kumar Sharma <accounts2 @tfepl.com>

Sent: 02 December 2024 16:01

To: support.safal@k-corp.in <support.safal@k-corp.in>

Cc: Dheeraj Yadav <dheeraj.yadav@travelfoodservices.com>; TFEPL Accounts <accounts@tfepl.com>
Subject: Re: E-Sourcing : K Hospitality Corp : Supplier Registration Log In Details

You don't often get email from accounts2@tfepl.com. Learn why this is important

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Team,
I'm Not Able To Upload My Documents.

Mr Kaushik Sharma
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s TOPLINE FOOD EQUIPMENT LLP
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On Mon, Dec 2, 2024 at 3:45 PM Akhilesh Singh <accounts@tfepl.com> wrote:

Akhilesh Singh
Top Line Food Equipment LLP

A1/68(LGF), Safdarjung Enclave
New Delhi-110029/India
Tel: +91 11 41006700

Web: www.tfepl.com

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: <no-reply@procuresens.com>

Date: Mon, Dec 2, 2024 at 3:44 PM

Subject: E-Sourcing : K Hospitality Corp : Supplier Registration Log In Details
To: <accounts@tfepl.com>

Dear Sir/ Madam,
Below are your Log In details to access eProcurement system for K Hospitality Corp

Please note that all communication shall happen through our eProcurement platform only

User Name / Code RV232410127

Password 081063

Please change your password once you log in first time.

Please contact Procurement Department, in case of further clarification.

5



URL : https://kcorp.procuresens.com/

Best Regards,

Procurement Department

OSPITALITY

K Hospitality Corp
1 Rashid Mansion, Worli Point, Mumbai - 400018, India

Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail.
This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply back to this email ID. You are advised to login to K Hospitality Corp for details. We
recommend making your Password confidential as confidentiality is completely supplier’s responsibility.



