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FYI & A.

From: FOOD SOLUTIONS <foodsolutiontvm@gmail.com>

Sent: 31 December 2024 16:19

To: Trivandrum Purchase <trivandrum.purchase@k-corp.in>

Cc: Selva Kumar <selvakumar.m@travelfoodservices.com>; Vijayakumar S <vijayakumar.s@k-corp.in>; Suman JHA <suman.jha@semolinakitchens.com>;
foodsolutiontvm@gmail.com; Mastercreation TFS <mastercreation.tfs@travelfoodservices.com>; syamjith choice&food solution <syamjithchoice@gmail.com>
Subject: Re: Change of Account Number -M/s Food Solutions

Dear Sir,

Kindly note that our Bank has changed from State Bank of India SME Branch to South Indian Bank Kumarapuram Branch



To, ' Date:10-12-2024

Sub: - Change of Account Number -M/s Food Solutions

We wish to inform that we have changed our existing Bank from State Bank of India SME
Branch to South Indian Bank Kumarapuram Branch, details of our new Bank would
be as detailed below:-

Mame: - M/s, Food Solutions

Account Number: - 0773081000000049

IFSC: - SIBLOOOOT 73

Branch: - Kumardpuram

Kindly, use our OD Bank as detailed above for future transfer of funds for eredit to our

account. The existing account with SBI Bank stands closed and future transfers may get
returned.

Thanking you



On Wed, Dec 11, 2024 at 5:29 PM Trivandrum Purchase <trivandrum.purchase@k-corp.in> wrote:

Team,

Pls share cancelled cheque.

Sheena R.

From: Mastercreation TFS <mastercreation.tfs@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: 11 December 2024 16:17

To: Trivandrum Purchase <trivandrum.purchase@k-corp.in>

Cc: Selva Kumar <selvakumar.m@travelfoodservices.com>; Vijayakumar S <vijayakumar.s@k-corp.in>; Suman JHA <suman.jha@semolinakitchens.com>;
foodsolutiontvm@gmail.com

Subject: RE: Change of Account Number -M/s Food Solutions

Dear Team,

Bank stamp or bank letter compulsory on bank details, otherwise send me cancelled cheque.

Thanks & Regards,

Ombkar Sawant



From: Trivandrum Purchase <trivandrum.purchase@k-corp.in>

Sent: 10 December 2024 18:40

To: Mastercreation TFS <mastercreation.tfs@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Selva Kumar <selvakumar.m@travelfoodservices.com>; Vijayakumar S <vijayakumar.s@k-corp.in>; Suman JHA <suman.jha@semolinakitchens.com>;
foodsolutiontvm@gmail.com

Subject: FW: Change of Account Number -M/s Food Solutions

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Team,

Pls go through below mail and do the needful to change bank details.

V000146 | Food Solutions

Sheena R.



From: FOOD SOLUTIONS <foodsolutiontvm@gmail.com>
Sent: 10 December 2024 17:44

To: CHOICE TRADE LINKS <ctltvm@gmail.com>

Subject: Change of Account Number -M/s Food Solutions

Dear Sir,

Kindly note that our Bank has changed from State Bank of India SME Branch to South Indian Bank Kumarapuram Branch



To, . Date:10-12-2024

ub: - Change of Account Number -M/s Food Solutions

We wish to inform that we have changed our existing Bank from State Bank of India SME
Branch to South Indian Bank Kumarapuram Branch, details of our new Bank would
be as detailed below:-

Mame: = M/s. Food Solwions

Account Number: - 077308 1000000049

IFSC: - SIBLODD0OTT73

Branch: - Kumardpuram

Kindly, use our OD Bank as detailed above for future transfer of funds for eredit to our

account. The existing account with SBI Bank stands closed and future transfers may get
returned.

Thanking you
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