Mastercreation TFS

From: Herambraj Sonawane <mumbai.purchase1@k-corp.in>

Sent: 16 April 2024 18:32

To: Mastercreation TFS

Cc: Lovejot Sekhon Kcorp

Subject: FW: Documents

Attachments: Cancelled Cheque.pdf; New GST Certificate.pdf; PAN Card.jpg; UDYAM CERTIFICATE.pdf; Aadhar Card.jpg

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Omkar

Kindly find attach document and update vendor code in TFSCPL .

supplier name name of the supplier | contact number | mail id

M A Electrical Solutions meghal 9930211622 | meghalparikh1969 @gmail.com

Thanks & Regards
Heramb

9702415737

From: Meghal Parikh <meghalparikh1969 @gmail.com>
Sent: Monday, August 21, 2023 4:30 PM

To: Herambraj Sonawane <mumbai.purchasel @k-corp.in>
Subject: Documents

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.
1



Sir
Please find attached

1) Gst Certificate

2) Pan Card

3) Adhar Card

4) Cancelled Cheque
5) MSME Certificate

Best Wishes,

M. A. Electrical Solutions

6/13, Matru Mandir Bldg, 278, Tardeo Road, Opp Bhatia Hospital, Mumbai — 400007.
Meghal Parikh

meghalparikh1969@gmail.com

+91-9930211622

Crystal Hospitality

info@crystal-hospitality.com

www.crystal-hospitality.com

Gr. Floor, "A" wing, Motiwala Mansion, 40, Forjet Street, Mumbai — 400026.
Adit Parikh

adtmprkh@gmail.com

+91-9930907674

GST NO : 27ANQPP1993A1ZP




