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Mastercreation TFS

From: Prasad Gurav
Sent: 01 October 2024 20:25
To: PRC MARKETING; Mastercreation TFS
Cc: Abhishek Das; Suman JHA; Mumbai Purchase; Vishal Gandhi; Anil Nayak; Jayesh Deherkar
Subject: RE: PAYMENT DETAILS
Attachments: PRC MARKETING  BANK ACCOUNT DETAILS.pdf

Dear Omkar , 
Please update attached account detail . 
 
 
 
 
Thanks & Regards , 
Prasad Gurav  
Procurement and Supplychain 
09594941985 
 

From: PRC MARKETING <prcmarketing85@gmail.com>  
Sent: 01 October 2024 19:49 
To: Prasad Gurav <prasad.gurav@semolinakitchens.com> 
Cc: Mastercreation TFS <mastercreation.tfs@travelfoodservices.com>; Abhishek Das <abhishek.das@semolinakitchens.com>; Suman JHA 
<suman.jha@semolinakitchens.com>; Mumbai Purchase <mumbai.purchase@travelfoodservices.com>; Vishal Gandhi <vishal.gandhi@k-corp.in>; Anil Nayak 
<anil.nayak@travelfoodservices.com>; Jayesh Deherkar <jayesh.deherkar@travelfoodservices.com> 
Subject: Re: PAYMENT DETAILS 
 
CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe. 

 
DEAR TEAM 
 
 
ATTACHMENTS  OF BANK DETAILS 
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REGARDS, 
 PRC MARKETING 
 
On Tue, Oct 1, 2024 at 11:36 AM Prasad Gurav <prasad.gurav@semolinakitchens.com> wrote: 

Dear Prc Team , 

Please share cancel cheque immediately . 

  

  

  

Thanks & Regards , 

Prasad Gurav  

Procurement and Supplychain 

09594941985 

  

From: Mastercreation TFS <mastercreation.tfs@travelfoodservices.com>  
Sent: 30 September 2024 18:29 
To: Prasad Gurav <prasad.gurav@semolinakitchens.com> 
Cc: Abhishek Das <abhishek.das@semolinakitchens.com>; Suman JHA <suman.jha@semolinakitchens.com>; Mumbai Purchase 
<mumbai.purchase@travelfoodservices.com>; Vishal Gandhi <vishal.gandhi@k-corp.in>; Anil Nayak <anil.nayak@travelfoodservices.com>; Jayesh Deherkar 
<jayesh.deherkar@travelfoodservices.com>; PRC MARKETING <prcmarketing85@gmail.com> 
Subject: RE: PAYMENT DETAILS 

  

Dear sir, 
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Please provide Cancelled cheque. 

  

  

Thanks & Regards, 

Omkar Sawant 

  

  

  

From: Prasad Gurav <prasad.gurav@semolinakitchens.com>  
Sent: 30 September 2024 15:40 
To: Mastercreation TFS <mastercreation.tfs@travelfoodservices.com> 
Cc: Abhishek Das <abhishek.das@semolinakitchens.com>; Suman JHA <suman.jha@semolinakitchens.com>; Mumbai Purchase 
<mumbai.purchase@travelfoodservices.com>; Vishal Gandhi <vishal.gandhi@k-corp.in>; Anil Nayak <anil.nayak@travelfoodservices.com>; Jayesh Deherkar 
<jayesh.deherkar@travelfoodservices.com>; PRC MARKETING <prcmarketing85@gmail.com> 
Subject: RE: PAYMENT DETAILS 

  

  

Dear Omkar , 

  

Please update PRC Marketing New bank detail further payment process . 
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AC Name: PRC MARKETING 

 Account Number : 15380200006889 
IFSC: FDRL0001538 

Branch Name : MUMBAI/GOREGAON 

  

  

  

Thanks & Regards , 

Prasad Gurav  

Procurement and Supplychain 

09594941985 

  

From: PRC MARKETING <prcmarketing85@gmail.com>  
Sent: 30 September 2024 15:48 
To: Prasad Gurav <prasad.gurav@semolinakitchens.com> 
Cc: Abhishek Das <abhishek.das@semolinakitchens.com>; Suman JHA <suman.jha@semolinakitchens.com>; Mumbai Purchase 
<MUMBAI.PURCHASE@travelfoodservices.com>; Vishal Gandhi <vishal.gandhi@k-corp.in>; Anil Nayak <anil.nayak@travelfoodservices.com>; Jayesh Deherkar 
<jayesh.deherkar@travelfoodservices.com> 
Subject: PAYMENT DETAILS 

  

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe. 

 Some people who received this message don't often get email from prcmarketing85@gmail.com. Learn why this is important   
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DEAR TEAM, 

  

  

 OUTSTANDING PAYMENT DETAILS OF HONEY 

  

ACCOUNT DETAILS OF PRC MARKETING 

  

 AC Name: PRC MARKETING 

 Account Number : 15380200006889 
IFSC: FDRL0001538 

Branch Name : MUMBAI/GOREGAON 

  

  

BELOW THE ATTACHMENTS OF OUTSTANDING PAYMENT DETAILS 

  

  

REGARDS , 

PRC MARKETING  . 


