Mastercreation TFS

From: Niraj Mandal

Sent: 14 May 2024 16:40

To: Mastercreation TFS

Cc: T1 IT Helpdesk; Samrat Narvekar; T1 IT Helpdesk; Support Safal; T1 IT Helpdesk; T1 IT Helpdesk
Subject: FW: Invoice Submission Rights.

Attachments: GST INV 017.pdf; GST INV 016.pdf

Dear Omkar,

As discussed please enable below vendor.
1. Communetiques

Contact Person : Ankit Chhatre

Phone : 8108140546

Email ID : ankit@communetigues.com

IT Support processes : Please raise an incident/ticket using the links provided below.
Self Service : https://app.assetinfinity.com/Account/MultiTenantLogin

Disclaimer : Minimal IT Support to be provided without incidents raised.

Thanks for reaching out to T1 IT Helpdesk. Have a nice day

Thanks & Regards,

Niraj Mandal.

Asst Manager - IT

Mob: +91 8655551767

Email Id :- niraj.mandal@travelfoodservices.com




it.helpdesk@travelfoodservices.com
Website: www.travelfoodservices.com

tls

From: Niraj Mandal

Sent: 04 May 2024 17:45

To: Support Safal <support.safal@k-corp.in>

Cc: T1 IT Helpdesk <it.helpdesk@travelfoodservices.com>; Samrat Narvekar <samrat.narvekar@travelfoodservices.com>; T1 IT Helpdesk
<it.helpdesk@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: RE: Invoice Submission Rights.

Dear Team,
Attached vendor is not showing in my dashboard kindly do the need full.
This vendor is old and its showing under MALS.

IT Support processes : Please raise an incident/ticket using the links provided below.
Self Service : https://app.assetinfinity.com/Account/MultiTenantLogin

Disclaimer : Minimal IT Support to be provided without incidents raised.

Thanks for reaching out to T1 IT Helpdesk. Have a nice day

Thanks & Regards,

Niraj Mandal.

Asst Manager - IT

Mob: +91 8655551767

Email Id :- niraj.mandal@travelfoodservices.com
it.helpdesk@travelfoodservices.com

Website: www.travelfoodservices.com
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From: Support Safal [mailto:support.safal@k-corp.in]
Sent: 29 April 2024 16:30




To: Niraj Mandal <niraj.mandal@travelfoodservices.com>
Cc: T1 IT Helpdesk <it.helpdesk@travelfoodservices.com>; Samrat Narvekar <samrat.narvekar@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: Re: Invoice Submission Rights.

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Niraj,
We have added invoice submission rights in your ID.

Regards,
Support

From: Niraj Mandal <niraj.mandal@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: 29 April 2024 15:30

To: Support Safal <support.safal@k-corp.in>

Cc: T1 IT Helpdesk <it.helpdesk@travelfoodservices.com>; Samrat Narvekar <samrat.narvekar@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: Invoice Submission Rights.

Dear Safal Team,
Requesting you to please give invoice submission rights to my ID.
Mial ID :- niraj.mandal@travelfoodservices.com.

IT Support processes : Please raise an incident/ticket using the links provided below.
Self Service : https://app.assetinfinity.com/Account/MultiTenantLogin

Disclaimer : Minimal IT Support to be provided without incidents raised.

Thanks for reaching out to T1 IT Helpdesk. Have a nice day

Thanks & Regards,

Niraj Mandal.

Asst Manager - IT

Mob: +91 8655551767

Email Id :- niraj.mandal@travelfoodservices.com
it.helpdesk@travelfoodservices.com

Website: www.travelfoodservices.com
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