Mastercreation TFS

From:

Sent:

To:

Cc:

Subject:
Attachments:

Dear Team,

Please unblock the code.

Ravi Shanker

24 May 2024 14:21

Mastercreation TFS

Karan Singh; Umesh Gupta; Siddhesh Dolas; Anil Nayak

RE: Vendor code Block for payment-Durga Enterprises

PAN CARD.pdf; DURGA GST (1).pdf; DURGA CANCLLED CHEQUE.pdf

GST Certificate ATTACHED

CIN Certificate N/A (proprietorship)
PAN Card ATTACHED
UDYAM MSME (If Applicable) NOT APPLICABLE
Cancelled Cheque ATTACHED

V1534 Durga Enterprises Books

Regards,
Ravi

From: Ravi Shanker

Sent: 24 May 2024 13:38

To: Karan Singh <karan.singh@travelretail.in>; Umesh Gupta <umesh.gupta@travelretail.in>
Subject: Vendor code Block for payment-Durga Enterprises

Dear Karan,

Please provide the below documents to unblock the code.



1 VRF

2-GST

3—-CIN

4 MSME

5 Pan card

6 — Cancelled cheque

Regards,
Ravi



