Mastercreation TFS

From: Priyoranjan Thoi <priyoranjan.thoi@k-corp.in>
Sent: 13 June 2024 16:33

To: Mastercreation TFS; Anil Nayak

Cc: Parag Pandey; Siddhesh Dolas; Kolkata Purchase
Subject: Re : Bank Account change - Vendor Debharat Pak
Attachments: Adobe Scan 13-Jun-2024 (9).pdf

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Omkar/Anil
Vendor — Debharat Pak ( V0000992 ) would has changed the bank account as per cancelled cheque attached. Pls update the same in the system & confirm.
Regs,

Priyo Ranjan Thoi
Travel Food Services

e

From: Abhishek mishra <sales@debharatpak.com>
Sent: 13 June 2024 04:26 PM

To: Priyoranjan Thoi <priyoranjan.thoi@k-corp.in>
Subject: Adobe Scan 13-Jun-2024 (9).pdf

Created and shared using Adobe Scan.

Dear sir

As discussed please find the cancel cheque



Regards
Abhisek Mishra



