Mastercreation TFS

From: Invoices TFS

Sent: 31 March 2024 10:58

To: Mastercreation TFS

Cc: Bhavika Patel; Trivandrum Purchase

Subject: FW: FW: Semolina - S M COMPUTERS - Vendor Blocked
Attachments: Udyam Registration Certificate - Copy.pdf; cancelled cheque.pdf
Hi Omkar,

Please unblock vendor code in Semolina

From: SM Computers <smcomp@gmail.com>

Sent: 27 March 2024 13:31

To: Trivandrum Purchase <trivandrum.purchase@k-corp.in>

Cc: Anuj Dubey <anuj.dubey@travelfoodservices.com>; Invoices TFS <invoices@travelfoodservices.com>; Mangesh
Dhumal <mangesh.dhumal@travelfoodservices.com>; Puneeth Kumar <puneeth.kumar@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: Re: FW: Semolina - S M COMPUTERS - Vendor Blocked

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize
the sender and know the content is safe.

Daer Sir,

FYR

Thanks & Regards

E : smcomp@gmail.com
M :+91 9150069713

W : www.smcomputers.in

SM Computers



Shop No. G4, Salma Arcades's
No.333,Arcot Road, Kodambakkam,
Chennai-600024. Contact : 044-23727772

Mobile : 96000 96130 / 98412 73303

On Wed, Mar 27, 2024 at 1:07 PM Trivandrum Purchase <trivandrum.purchase@k-corp.in> wrote:

Sir,

Kindly share below documents.

Cancelled cheque

UDYAM MSME

Sheena R.

From: Invoices TFS <invoices@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: 27 March 2024 12:13

To: Trivandrum Purchase <trivandrum.purchase@Xk-corp.in>
Cc: Bhavika Patel <bhavika.patel@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: FW: Semolina - S M COMPUTERS - Vendor Blocked

Hi Sheena,

Please arrange Documents from vendor to unblock his code in system.

From: Mastercreation TFS <mastercreation.tfs@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: 27 March 2024 12:11

To: Bhavika Patel <bhavika.patel@travelfoodservices.com>

Cec: Anuj Dubey <anuj.dubey@travelfoodservices.com>; Invoices TFS
<invoices@travelfoodservices.com>; Mangesh Dhumal <mangesh.dhumal@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: RE: Semolina - S M COMPUTERS - Vendor Blocked




Dear Bhavika,

Kindly Provide Cancelled cheque and UDYAM MSME.

Thanks & Regards,

Omkar Sawant

From: Bhavika Patel <bhavika.patel@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: 26 March 2024 15:59

To: Mastercreation TFS <mastercreation.tfs@travelfoodservices.com>

Cec: Anuj Dubey <anuj.dubey@travelfoodservices.com>; Invoices TFS
<invoices@travelfoodservices.com>; Mangesh Dhumal <mangesh.dhumal@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: Semolina - S M COMPUTERS - Vendor Blocked

Dear Omkar,

As per the above mentioned subject, please provide us with the list of documents required for unblocking
the said vendor.

Below are the details of vendor.

Entity: SEMOLINA

Vendor Code: v000004

Vendor Name: S M COMPUTERS

Further, I have attached print screen of the said vendor for your reference.
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