Mastercreation TFS

From:

Sent:

To:

Cc:

Subject:
Attachments:

Herambraj Sonawane <mumbai.purchase1@k-corp.in>

29 January 2024 19:36

Mastercreation TFS

Lovejot Sekhon Kcorp

FW: VRF- Cash safe - Cash counting

K CORP.pdf; Adhar Card Vinod New.pdf; Gumasta.pdf; GST Registration
Certificate.pdf; Cancel cheque.pdf; Bank Detail 23 May 20.jpg; MSME Certificate.pdf;
Pan Card With Stamp.jpg; Vendor Registration 23 May 20.jpg

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize

the sender and know the ¢

ontent is safe.

Dear Omkar

Kindly update code in TFSPL

V0000652

supplyer name

name of the supplier | contact number | mail id

V D Enterprises

Nitesh 8108113383 | saleslockerhub@gmail.com

Thanks & Regards
Heramb

9702415737

From: Godrej Locker Sales Hub <saleslockerhub@gmail.com>
Sent: Thursday, February 23, 2023 5:06 PM

To: Herambraj Sonawan

e <mumbai.purchasel@k-corp.in>

Cc: Kamal Saraf <kamal.saraf@k-corp.in>; Ayush Haldia <ayush.haldia@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: Re: VRF- Cash s

Regards,
Team Sales
(V.D.ENTERPRISE

™

afe - Cash counting

S)



Head Office | V.D.Enterprises™ | Shop No.6, Shelter House CHS, Sector - 05, Beside
Bharat Bank, Ghansoli, Navi Mumbai-400701 | Mob:-+91 8108113383, 8108113377 /
78 | www.godrejlockerhub.com © |

On Thu, Feb 23, 2023 at 3:35 PM Herambraj Sonawane <mumbai.purchasel@k-corp.in> wrote:

Hi,

Request to please have the attached documents filled and signed be submitted with us along with
scan copy of cancelled chq, pan copy, gst cert and MSME Certificate (If Registered ) . to have your
company registered with us for records and process of payments.

This details are required for our MALS , TFSPL And TFSKPL ,GMR GOA MOPA,SKPL ,BLR

Regards

Herambraj

9702415737



