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Mastercreation TFS

From: Harish MR
Sent: 09 February 2024 13:22
To: Mastercreation TFS
Cc: Jayesh Deherkar; Anil Nayak; omtraders 97
Subject: Fwd: Account Statement from April to 30th November
Attachments: ICICI BANK CANCELLED CHQ OM TRADERS.pdf; ICICI BANK DETAILS OM 

TRADERS.docx

Dear Omkar, 
 
Please change the bank details as per the below request. 
 
Thanks & Regards,  
Harish M R  
Assistant Manager – SCM & Procurement.  
+91 99640 88755  
 

From: omtraders 97 <omtraders1997@gmail.com> 
Sent: Friday, February 9, 2024 13:19 
To: Harish MR <harish.mr@travelfoodservices.com> 
Cc: T2 BLR Stores <t2blr.stores@travelfoodservices.com> 
Subject: Re: Account Statement from April to 30th November 
  
CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize 
the sender and know the content is safe. 

 
Concern, 
As mentioned above we request you please make changes with our account as we have closed the account 
with CANARA BANK.  
We will not be liable for any amount transferred to the CANARA BANK account henceforth. 
Regards 
Nandini H R 
Accounts 
Om Traders 
 
On Thu, Dec 14, 2023 at 3:20 PM omtraders 97 <omtraders1997@gmail.com> wrote: 
PFA 
 
On Thu, Dec 14, 2023 at 3:13 PM Harish MR <harish.mr@travelfoodservices.com> wrote: 

Dear Nandhini, 

  

Please share us in excel. 

  

Thanks & regards,  
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Harish M R  

Assistant Manager – SCM & Procurement.  

+91 99640 88755  

  

From: omtraders 97 <omtraders1997@gmail.com>  
Sent: Thursday, December 14, 2023 15:10 PM 
To: Harish MR <harish.mr@travelfoodservices.com> 
Cc: T2 BLR Stores <t2blr.stores@travelfoodservices.com> 
Subject: Re: Account Statement from April to 30th November 

  

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you 
recognize the sender and know the content is safe. 

  

Concern,  

Please find the attached below ledger statement. 

Regards 

Nandini H R 

Accounts 

Om Tarders 

  

  

On Thu, Dec 14, 2023 at 10:33 AM Harish MR <harish.mr@travelfoodservices.com> wrote: 

Dear All, 

  

Please share with us the Account Statement from April 1st to 30th November for reconciliation. 

  

  

Thanks & regards,  

Harish M R  
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Assistant Manager – SCM & Procurement.  

+91 99640 88755  

---------------------------------------------------  

Travel Food Services PVT LTD,  

Room No.20, Alpha building 3,  

Kempegowda International Airport – Bangalore 560300  

  

 

  


