Mastercreation TFS

From: Vijayakumar S <vijayakumar.s@k-corp.in>

Sent: 22 May 2024 14:59

To: Mastercreation TFS

Cc: Chennai Purchase; Kumar V; Selvakumar M

Subject: FW: Quotation for Bundle Counting Machine

Attachments: GST Reg Cert.pdf; ChgPNBC.pdf; PAN Copy.jpg; MSME decl 2024.docx
Importance: High

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Omkar,
Kindly activate the vendor Acme Systems & Sales

Vendor No. Vendor Name
V0000956 ACME SYSTEMS SERVICES
GST CERTIFICATE 33ALTPK4048A1ZA
CIN CERTIFICATE Not Applicable
XE:S&E/EME IF Not Applicable
CANCELLED CHEQUE Attached
PAN CARD Attached
EMAIL ID msacme.ss@gmail.com
CONTACT DETAILS 9840090243

Regards

Vijay

From: Acme Systems <msacme.ss@gmail.com>
Sent: 22 May 2024 14:45



To: Vijayakumar S <vijayakumar.s@k-corp.in>
Subject: Re: Quotation for Bundle Counting Machine

Dear Sir,
Please find the below attached required documents.

On Tue, May 21, 2024 at 5:46 PM Vijayakumar S <vijayakumar.s@Xk-corp.in> wrote:

Dear Sir,

Kindly provide the below details.

Vendor No. Vendor Name
V0000372 Acme Systems & Services
GST CERTIFICATE
CIN CERTIFICATE Not Applicable
UDYAM MSME IF
APPLICABLE
CANCELLED CHEQUE
PAN CARD
EMAIL ID msacme.ss@gmail.com
CONTACT DETAILS 9840090243

Regards

Vijay



From: Acme Systems <msacme.ss@gmail.com>
Sent: 21 May 2024 11:44

To: Vijayakumar S <vijayakumar.s@k-corp.in>
Subject: Quotation for Bundle Counting Machine

Dear Sir,
Please find attached the company profile, quotation and picture of Bundle Counting Machine.

We also deal with products like Currency Counting Machine, Currency Verifying Machines, Binding Machines and Lamination machines. We
would be happy to help you with the service of these products too.

Regards
Ishwarni
Acme Systems

9840119889

Regards
Vijayashree
Acme Systems
9840119889



