Mastercreation TFS

From: Anil Nayak

Sent: 26 March 2024 14:54

To: Mastercreation TFS

Cc: Mumbai Purchase; Parag Pandey; Siddhesh Dolas
Subject: RE: Please change our bank details in your recoed
Attachments: Cancelled Chq.jpg

Dear Omkar,
Please update new bank in ledger.

Entity: TFSPL
Code: V0002791
Name: Brijwasi Wafers & Namkeen

Regards
Anil

From: BRIJWASI NAMKEEN <brijwasi.lalit@gmail.com>

Sent: 26 March 2024 14:28

To: Anil Nayak <anil.nayak@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Mumbai Purchase <mumbai.purchase@travelfoodservices.com>; Mastercreation TFS
<mastercreation.tfs@travelfoodservices.com>; Jayesh Deherkar <jayesh.deherkar@travelfoodservices.com>; Parag
Pandey <parag.pandey@travelfoodservices.com>; Siddhesh Dolas <siddhesh.dolas@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: Re: Please change our bank details in your recoed

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize
the sender and know the content is safe.

On Tue, Mar 26, 2024 at 1:54 PM Anil Nayak <anil.nayak@travelfoodservices.com> wrote:

Dear Khushal,

We need Cancel Cheque copy, kindly arrange and share.

Regards

Anil

From: Mumbai Purchase <mumbai.purchase@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: 26 March 2024 12:48

To: Mastercreation TFS <mastercreation.tfs@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: BRIJWASI NAMKEEN <brijwasi.lalit@gmail.com>; Jayesh Deherkar <jayesh.deherkar@travelfoodservices.com>;
1




Anil Nayak <anil.nayak@travelfoodservices.com>; Parag Pandey <parag.pandey@travelfoodservices.com>;
Siddhesh Dolas <siddhesh.dolas@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: Please change our bank details in your recoed

Dear Omkar
Please change vendor bank details in our record for transfer of payments.

Following are the details and check attached cancelled cheque

Bank Details

Bank Name Axis Bank Ltd

A/C No. 918020039787912

IFSC Code UTIBO001347

Branch Sunder Nagar Malad west

Please change bank details in the following Company
1. Travel Food Service Pvt Ltd
2. Semolina Kitchens Pvt Ltd

3. Mumbai Airport Lounge Services Private Limited

Regards

Khushal Gosavi | Travel Food Services Pvt Ltd| E: mumbai.purchase@travelfoodservices.com
www.k-hospitality.com| Think before You print.|

Mobile No - 7506099544

#BesaD-

AT HOME I WORK | TRAVEI



From: BRIJWASI NAMKEEN <brijwasi.lalit@gmail.com>

Sent: 20 March 2024 05:55 PM

To: Mumbai Purchase <mumbai.purchase@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: Re: Please change our bank details in your recoed

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize
the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Sir,

Reminder for make necessary changes in our bank details again and again all the payment recd in our old
Bank account which was close

Please do the necessary changes and please check attached ledger copy

On Sat, Mar 9, 2024 at 12:11 PM BRIJWASI NAMKEEN <brijwasi.lalit@gmail.com> wrote:

Dear Sir/Madam,
Please change our bank details in your record for transfer of our payments.

Following are the details and check attached cancelled cheque

Bank Details

Bank Name Axis Bank Ltd

A/C No. 918020039787912

IFSC Code UTIB0O001347

Branch Sunder Nagar Malad west

Please change bank details in the following Company and cooperate us
1. Travel Food Service Pvt Ltd
2. Semolina Kitchens Pvt Ltd

3. Mumbai Airport Lounge Services Private Limited



With Regards,

Rupal Pattnayak
Accounts Executive

Accounts Department

BRIJWASI WAFERS & NAMKEEN,

OFFICE ADDRESS: 85/11 CHITNIS COMPOUND VIJAYKAR WADI S.V ROAD
MOBILE.....9867262270AD WEST MUMBALI - 400 064

With Regards,

Rupal Pattnayak

Accounts Executive



Accounts Department

BRIJWASI WAFERS & NAMKEEN,

OFFICE ADDRESS: 85/11 CHITNIS COMPOUND VIJAYKAR WADI S.V ROAD
MOBILE.....9867262270AD WEST MUMBALI - 400 064



