Mastercreation TFS

From: Herambraj Sonawane <mumbai.purchase1@k-corp.in>

Sent: 11 March 2024 17:16

To: Mastercreation TFS

Cc: Sarvesh Yelekar; Lovejot Sekhon Kcorp

Subject: FW: VRF - REGISTRATION

Attachments: GK ENGINEERS MSME 2.pdf; GST Certificate GK ENGINEERS (1).pdf; GK engg pan

card.pdf; cancale cheque BOB 1 (1).jpg

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize
the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Omkar

As discussed update vendor code With above document share and Update vendor code for this,

V0002520

supplyer name name of the supplier contact number mail id

G K ENGINEERS
Nasim Shaikh

0822586679 | gkengineers74@gmail.com

Thanks & Regards
Heramb

9702415737

From: nasim shaikh <gkengineers74@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, March 11, 2024 12:36 PM

To: Herambraj Sonawane <mumbai.purchasel@k-corp.in>; sarvesh.yelekar@travelfoodservices.com
Subject: Fwd: VRF - REGISTRATION

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: nasim shaikh <gkengineers74@gmail.com>

Date: Wed, 6 Mar 2024 at 14:41

Subject: Re: VRF - REGISTRATION

To: Herambraj Sonawane <mumbai.purchasel @k-corp.in>

Dear sIR,

I am sending for - PAN CARD , GST CERTIFICATE, CANCEL CHEQUE ,MSME , by attachment

1



G K ENGINEERS

NASIM

9822586679

On Tue, 5 Mar 2024 at 20:07, Herambraj Sonawane <mumbai.purchasel @k-corp.in> wrote:

Dear Nasim

Kindly find attach form provide — PAN CARD , GST CERTIFICATE, CANCEL CHEQUE ,MSME ,

Thanks & Regards

Heramb

9702415737



