Mastercreation TFS

From: Invoices TFS

Sent: 28 May 2024 10:47

To: Mastercreation TFS

Cc: Nayana Saha; Parag Pandey
Subject: RE: Uploading invoices in SAFAL
Attachments: FW: MALS - M24 Stat Audit Invoice
Hi Omkar,

Please activate vender code in safal for all Entity where ledger available
Vendor Name : B S R and Associates LLP
Contact Person Name : Sandeep Kalantri
Contact Number : 9773346617
Email ID : sandeepkalantri@bsraffiliates.com

From: Nayana Saha <nayana.saha@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: 28 May 2024 10:15

To: Invoices TFS <invoices@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: Uploading invoices in SAFAL

Hi Sawalaram,

Kindly upload the invoice in SAFAL under pre approved as we do not have this right.

Approval mail is attached.

Regards,
Nayana Saha



