Mastercreation TFS

From: Siddhesh Dolas

Sent: 04 May 2024 16:28

To: Mastercreation TFS

Cc: Anil Nayak

Subject: FW: SANJU SEA FOOD-TFSPL-Required cancel cheque copy
Attachments: bank account.pdf

Dear Omkar,
Please update bank details in vendor code.

Entity -TFSPL

Vendor Code | Beneficiary Name
V0002525 SANJU SEA FOOD

Best Regards,
Siddhesh Dolas

From: Sanju Gad <sanjuseafoods123@gmail.com>

Sent: 04 May 2024 16:26

To: Siddhesh Dolas <siddhesh.dolas@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: Re: SANJU SEA FOOD-TFSPL-Required cancel cheque copy

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

On Sat, 4 May 2024 at 11:46 AM, Siddhesh Dolas <siddhesh.dolas@travelfoodservices.com> wrote:

1



Hi,

Pls share cancel cheque PDF copy.

Best Regards,

Siddhesh Dolas

From: Siddhesh Dolas

Sent: 15 April 2024 09:39

To: Sanju Gad <sanjuseafoods123@gmail.com>

Subject: RE: SANJU SEA FOOD-TFSPL-Required cancel cheque copy

Hi,

Cheque copy is not clear pls share in PDF format



Best Regards,

Siddhesh Dolas

From: Sanju Gad <sanjuseafoods123@gmail.com>

Sent: 05 April 2024 07:20

To: Siddhesh Dolas <siddhesh.dolas@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: Re: SANJU SEA FOOD-TFSPL-Required cancel cheque copy

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

New iob check.docx



On Thu, 4 Apr 2024 at 5:20 PM, Siddhesh Dolas <siddhesh.dolas@travelfoodservices.com> wrote:

Hi,

Please share updated Bank details for payment processing.

Share Cancel cheque copy.

Best Regards,
Siddhesh Dolas

Travel food services Pvt Ltd



