Mastercreation TFS

From: Herambraj Sonawane <mumbai.purchase1@k-corp.in>

Sent: 16 April 2024 18:33

To: Mastercreation TFS

Cc: Nashid Ahmed

Subject: FW: VRF-

Attachments: FFS GST CERTI (1) (1) (3) (1) (1) (1) (1) (1) (1).pdf; FFS OD CANCELLED CHEQUE.pdf; FAST FIRE SERVICE Print _ Udyam Registration

Certificate.pdf;, 1529311072299 _scan 1 (3) (2) (1).jpg

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Omkar

Kindly find attach document and update vendor code in BLSPL.

supplier name name of the supplier | contact number | mail id
FAST FIRE
SERVICE Anand 9901192228 | fastfireservice@gmail.com

Thanks & Regards
Heramb

9702415737

From: fastfire service <fastfireservice@gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, January 10, 2024 6:59 PM

To: Herambraj Sonawane <mumbai.purchasel@k-corp.in>

Cc: Capex Purchase <capex.purchase@travelfoodservices.com>; Nashid Ahmed <nashid.ahmed@blrlounge.in>
Subject: Re: VRF-



dear sir please find the attached documents

Thanks & Regards
Anand ( Proprietor )

FAST FIRE SERVICE

No.3/1, 2nd Cross, Hucchappa Layout
SVG Nagar,Moodalapalya,Nagarabhavi,
Bangalore-560072
MOB:9901192228/9738544651

E-Mail: fastfireservice@gmail.com
Web: www.fastfireservice.com

On Wed, Jan 10, 2024 at 6:44 PM Herambraj Sonawane <mumbai.purchasel@k-corp.in> wrote:

Dear sir

Kindly provide VRF — GST CERTIFICATE , PAN CARD ,CANCEL CHQUE ,MSME CERTIFICATE

Thanks & Regards

Heramb

9702415737






