Mastercreation TFS

From: Invoices TFS

Sent: 19 April 2024 12:18

To: Mastercreation TFS

Cc: Binu Balachandran; Vivian Gracias; Parag Pandey; Kamlesh Patil; Sanjay Pimenta; Dickson Almeida
Subject: RE: Invoice upload access

Hi Omkar,

Please activate vendor code in MALS..

No. Vendor Name
V0000223 Santosh Dhotre

Email ID : santoshconsult@gmail.com
Contact Person Name : Santosh Dhotre
Phone Number : 9869108891

From: Dickson Almeida <dickson.almeida@mumbailounge.in>

Sent: 19 April 2024 11:09

To: Support Safal <support.safal@k-corp.in>

Cc: Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@travelfoodservices.com>; Vivian Gracias <vivian.gracias@mumbailounge.in>; Parag Pandey
<parag.pandey@travelfoodservices.com>; Invoices TFS <invoices@travelfoodservices.com>; Kamlesh Patil <kamlesh.patil@travelfoodservices.com>; Sanjay Pimenta
<sanjay.pimenta@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: RE: Invoice upload access

Dear Binu,
I am not able to get the supplier code for monthly FLR book maintenance charges for Santosh Dhotre. Please create the code and keep us posted.

Please find below screen short.
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Thank you & warm regards,

Dickson Almeida.

Lounge Head- Operations
Mumbai Airport Lounge Services.
Mobile: 9145088725.

Email:_Dickson.almeida@mumbailounge.in
CELEBRATING
Creating memories and inspiring
happiness through food, since 1972
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From: Support Safal <support.safal@k-corp.in>

Sent: Thursday, April 18, 2024 1:50 PM

To: Dickson Almeida <dickson.almeida@mumbailounge.in>

Cc: Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@travelfoodservices.com>; Vivian Gracias <vivian.gracias@mumbailounge.in>
Subject: Re: Invoice upload access

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Dickson,

We have added invoice rights in your ID kindly refresh you page and check it.

Regards,
Support



From: Dickson Almeida <dickson.almeida@mumbailounge.in>

Sent: 18 April 2024 12:27

To: Support Safal <support.safal@k-corp.in>

Cc: Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@travelfoodservices.com>; Vivian Gracias <vivian.gracias@mumbailounge.in>
Subject: Invoice upload access

Dear Team,

I need invoice upload access for safal app. Please activate the same.

Thank you & warm regards,

Dickson Almeida.

Lounge Head- Operations
Mumbai Airport Lounge Services.
Mobile: 9145088725.

Email: Dickson.almeida@mumbailounge.in
CELEBRATING
Creating memories and inspiring
happiness through food, since 1972
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