Mastercreation TFS

From:

Sent:

To:

Cc:

Subject:
Attachments:

Herambraj Sonawane <mumbai.purchase1@k-corp.in>

21 March 2024 11:42

Mastercreation TFS

Shashank Mahadik; Lovejot Sekhon Kcorp

FW: Pan details

IMG_20240321_112812268_2.jpg; cancelled cheque.jpg; GST provisional
certificate.pdf

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize
the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Omkar

update vendor code With above document share ,

VENDO0505

BLSPL ENTITY

supplyer name

name of the supplier contact number mail id

GUPTA ELECTRICALS

NARENDRA K.P. 9845495322 | eng.guptaelectricals@gmail.com

Thanks & Regards
Heramb

9702415737

From: Gupta Electricals <eng.guptaelectricals@gmail.com>
Sent: Thursday, March 21, 2024 11:38 AM
To: Herambraj Sonawane <mumbai.purchasel@k-corp.in>

Subject: Pan details

Dear sir,

As required by you, PFA our PAN, GST AND cancelled cheque.

Thanks & Regards

NARENDRA K.P.

GUPTA ELECTRICALS
#4. KV temple street

1st cross sowrashtrapet
Near Gobi corner




Bangalore -53
Phone : 080-22262479
Mobile : 9845495322



