Swapnil Sutar

From: Pankaj Sakarkar <pankajsakarkar@bluestarindia.com>
Sent: 05 July 2024 15:22

To: Swapnil Sutar

Cc: Abdul Rehman

Subject: RE: Need quote Water dispenser bubble top

Dear Swapnil,

Pls find below quote.

BWD3FMCGA - Water Dispenser Without Fridge - 7800/-
BWD3FMRGA - Water Dispenser with Fridge - 8500/-

Regards
Pankaj

From: Swapnil Sutar [mailto:swapnil.sutar@k-corp.in]
Sent: Friday, July 5, 2024 2:58 PM

Cc: Abdul Rehman <abdul.rehman@k-corp.in>
Subject: Need quote Water dispenser bubble top

CAUTION: ** This mail has been sent from outside Blue Star. Please open attachments/links after validating credentials. **

Dear Partner,
Please quote for Water dispenser bubble top.

Thanks & Regards,

Swapnil Sutar
H | & +919987022136
Travel Food Services Pvt. Limited.



