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Abdul Rehman

From: riya sales <riya.sales01@gmail.com>
Sent: 25 July 2024 15:55
To: Abdul Rehman
Cc: Sandeep Bhat; Swapnil Sutar; Rishabh Rawal
Subject: Re: Manesar dhaba Fabricated requirement

Dear Abdul Ji, 
 
We are okay with these rates. 
Kindly proceed further & release P.O. asap. 
 
THANKS AND REGARDS 
RISHABH RAWAL 
RIYA SALES 

 
 
 
 
On Thu, Jul 25, 2024 at 3:36 PM Abdul Rehman <abdul.rehman@k-corp.in> wrote: 

Dear Rishabh,  

  

As discussed with you, PFB targeted rated, please share your no regret price.  



2

  

  riya Sales 
S. 

No. Equipment Dimensions Qty Rate Amount Target Amount  Target rate  

3 SS STAND WITH TWO SHELVES BELOW 1050Wx600Dx600H+50 
HIGH 1 14500 14500 14500 14500 

10 SS WORKING TABLE WITH TWO 
SHELVES BELOW 

900Wx700Dx850H+50 
HIGH 1 13500 13500 13500 13500 

13 SS WORKING TABLE WITH TWO 
SHELVES BELOW 

400Wx700Dx850H+50 
HIGH 1 8000 8000 8000 8000 

16 SS PARTITION 600Wx300H 1 3500 3500 3500 3500 
24 MS STAND (LOW HT.) AS/SPEC. 1200Wx450DX100H 2 7000 14000 5500 11000 
26 SS TROLLY with castor wheels  450Wx450DX850H 1 10500 10500 10500 10500 
31 MS RACK WITH 5 SHELVES 900Wx450DX1800H 1 4500 4500 4500 4500 
32 OGT 600 x 400 x 400 1 15500 15500 15500 15500 
34 SS DRAIN JAALI 300WX300D 2 5000 10000 5000 10000 
  Freight   1 9000 9000 9000 9000 
          103000   100000 

  

  

Thanks & Regards, 

Abdul Rehman 

📱 | ☎  +91 9920292129 

Travel Food Services Pvt. Limited. 

  

From: riya sales <riya.sales01@gmail.com>  
Sent: 25 July 2024 12:52 
To: Abdul Rehman <abdul.rehman@k-corp.in> 
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Cc: Sandeep Bhat <sandeep.bhat@k-corp.in>; Swapnil Sutar <swapnil.sutar@k-corp.in>; Rishabh Rawal <rawalrishabh6@gmail.com> 
Subject: Re: Manesar dhaba Fabricated requirement 

  

Hi Abdul Ji, 

Greetings from RIYA SALES !! 

  

Pfa quotation below against your new requirement. 

Kindly check & release P.O. with advance payment to start production asap. 

  

THANKS AND REGARDS 

RISHABH RAWAL 

RIYA SALES 
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On Thu, Jul 25, 2024 at 11:25 AM Abdul Rehman <abdul.rehman@k-corp.in> wrote: 

Dear Partners,  

  

Need quote for below mentioned equipment for our upcoming outlet in Manesar.  

  

S. 
No. 

Equipment Dimensions 
Qty Category 

3 SS STAND WITH TWO SHELVES 
BELOW 

1050Wx600Dx600H+50 
HIGH 1 Fabrication 

10 SS WORKING TABLE WITH TWO 
SHELVES BELOW 

900Wx700Dx850H+50 
HIGH 1 Fabrication 

13 SS WORKING TABLE WITH TWO 
SHELVES BELOW 

400Wx700Dx850H+50 
HIGH 1 Fabrication 

16 SS PARTITION 600Wx300H 1 Fabrication 
24 MS STAND (LOW HT.) AS/SPEC. 1200Wx450DX100H 2 Fabrication 
26 SS TROLLY with castor wheels  450Wx450DX850H 1 Fabrication 

32 OGT 600 x 400 x 400 1 OGT 

  

Thanks & Regards, 

Abdul Rehman 

📱 | ☎  +91 9920292129 

Travel Food Services Pvt. Limited. 

  


