Herambraj Sonawane

From: Samrat Narvekar <samrat.narvekar@travelfoodservices.com>
Sent: Saturday, January 20, 2024 12:07 PM

To: Herambraj Sonawane

Subject: FW: Pricing

PFB

From: Divyanshu Jain <divyanshu.jain@Tech4logic.com>

Sent: 19 January 2024 16:44

To: Samrat Narvekar <samrat.narvekar@travelfoodservices.com>
Cc: Herambraj Sonawane <mumbai.purchasel@k-corp.in>
Subject: Pricing

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the
sender and know the content is safe.

Dear sir

As discussed with you over call please find the price of your requirement as mentioned below.

HP 128nw — 19000+ GST

Thanks & Regards

Divyanshu Rai Jain

BUSINESS DEVELOPMENT MANAGER

MOBILE : 8976829329

EMAIL ID : DIVYANSHU.JAIN@TECH4LOGIC.COM
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