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Swapnil Sutar

Subject: Need quote- MALS-2324-00044
Attachments: Q303.pdf

 
 
Thanks & Regards, 
 
Swapnil Sutar 
📱 | ☎  +91 9987022136 
Travel Food Services Pvt. Limited. 
 
From: Amma Enterprises <ammaenterpriseschennai@gmail.com>  
Sent: 29 March 2024 12:20 
To: Swapnil Sutar <swapnil.sutar@k-corp.in> 
Cc: Sandeep Bhat <sandeep.bhat@k-corp.in>; Abdul Rehman <abdul.rehman@k-corp.in> 
Subject: Re: Need quote- MALS-2324-00044 
Dear Sir, 
 
Greetings from Amma Enterprises! 
 
Please find attached herewith price quote for Bibus control for domestic lounge tilting pan, MODEL NO :5507 
. 
    Rupees 18,500 
 
 
Thanks & Regards. 
 
K. Prakash 
Amma  Enterprises 
No : 12B, Raghavan Nagar Main Road 
Near Amudham Nagar Arch 
Kodungaiyur,  
Chennai - 600 118. 
ammaenterpriseschennai@gmail.com. 
Phone : 99402 50078/84285 38078  
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GST no: 33AZHPP6284F1Z5 
 
 
 
 
On Thu, 28 Mar 2024 at 17:10, Swapnil Sutar <swapnil.sutar@k-corp.in> wrote: 

Hi Partner, 

Please share the quote as per below… 

  

Bibus control  

for domestic 

lounge tilting pan, 

MODEL NO : 

5507 

 

Thanks & Regards, 

  

Swapnil Sutar 

📱 | ☎  +91 9987022136 

Travel Food Services Pvt. Limited. 

  


