Ramendra Singh

From: Pcs Courier <pcs.courier@gmail.com>

Sent: 28 November 2024 14:42

To: Ramendra Singh

Cc: Ebrahim Anis Shaikh; Sandeep Bhat K-Corp; Shashikant Vishwakarma; Suman JHA;
Ameet.Koomar; Lovejot Sekhon Kcorp; Gautam; Surajit Banerjee; Abhishek Das

Subject: Re: Material readiness for Trivandrum

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the
sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Mr. Ramendra,
Greetings!

As per the telephonic conversation between Mr. Zafar and yourself regarding the 14 Ft Truck FTL service from
Western Ref to Semolina Kitchen, Trivandrum, we would like to confirm the following cost details:

Rs. 51,250/- Freight

Rs. 50/- Docket / LR

Rs. 1181/- Insurance

+

Fov @0.2%

Fsc @10%

Gst @ 5%

Please feel free to reach out for any clarifications or additional information.
Looking forward to your confirmation.
Regards,

Vikash Sah

EXPRESS

Every Time, On Time.

Email : pes.courier@gmail.com

On Thu, Nov 28, 2024 at 11:07 AM Pcs Courier <pcs.courier@gmail.com> wrote:

Transport Id
27AARPH3638J1ZA
PCS EXPRESS CARGO



Regards,

Vikash Sah

EXPRESS

Every Time, On Time.

Email : pecs.courier@gmail.com

On Thu, Nov 28, 2024 at 10:42 AM Ramendra Singh <ramendra.singh@semolinakitchens.com> wrote:

Dear vikas,

Kindly pick up the same

Thanks & Regards,
Ramendra Singh

9999118677

From: Gautam <ggautam@westernequipments.com>

Sent: 28 November 2024 10:40

To: Ramendra Singh <ramendra.singh@semolinakitchens.com>; 'Surajit Banerjee'
<bsurajit@westernequipments.com>; Abhishek Das <abhishek.das@semolinakitchens.com>

Cc: Ebrahim Anis Shaikh <ebrahim.shaikh@semolinakitchens.com>; Sandeep Bhat K-Corp <sandeep.bhat@k-
corp.in>; 'Shashikant Vishwakarma' <shashikant.vishwakarma@k-corp.in>; Suman JHA
<suman.jha@semolinakitchens.com>; Ameet.Koomar <Ameet.Koomar@adani.com™>; Lovejot Sekhon Kcorp
<lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>

Subject: RE: Material readiness for Trivandrum

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments
unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Mr. Ramendra,



Please find below pick up address :

Western Refrigeration Pvt. Ltd. - 1171

C/o.Neeta Logistics, Building No A-12, Gala No 7-13,
Paramount Logitrade Centre Janwal, Bhiwandi Nashik
Highway,Lonand Village,

Thane 421302 Maharashtra INDIA

GST No.: 27TAAACWO0012H1ZU State Code: 27

Rashid — 8097488219.

Please provide transporter details for invoicing.

Regards,

Gautam

From: Ramendra Singh <ramendra.singh@semolinakitchens.com>

Sent: Wednesday, November 27, 2024 3:20 PM

To: Gautam <ggautam@westernequipments.com>; 'Surajit Banerjee' <bsurajit@westernequipments.com>; Abhishek
Das <abhishek.das@semolinakitchens.com>

Cc: Ebrahim Anis Shaikh <ebrahim.shaikh@semolinakitchens.com>; Sandeep Bhat K-Corp <sandeep.bhat@k-
corp.in>; 'Shashikant Vishwakarma' <shashikant.vishwakarma@k-corp.in>; Suman JHA
<suman.jha@semolinakitchens.com>; Ameet.Koomar <Ameet.Koomar@adani.com™>; Lovejot Sekhon Kcorp
<lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>

Subject: RE: Material readiness for Trivandrum

CAUTION : This Email originated from outside of the organization. Please do not open attachments or click
links from an unknown or suspicious origin.

Dear Gautam J1i,

There is no need to revise the PO. We will process the invoice amount with 18% GST as per the current
terms.

@Abhishek: Kindly confirm if there are any issues with this regarding the GRN and advance adjustment.
3



Thanks & Regards,
Ramendra Singh

9999118677

From: Gautam <ggautam@westernequipments.com>

Sent: 27 November 2024 15:08

To: Ramendra Singh <ramendra.singh@semolinakitchens.com>; 'Surajit Banerjee'
<bsurajit@westernequipments.com>

Cc: Ebrahim Anis Shaikh <ebrahim.shaikh@semolinakitchens.com>; Sandeep Bhat K-Corp <sandeep.bhat@k-
corp.in>; 'Shashikant Vishwakarma' <shashikant.vishwakarma(@k-corp.in>; Abhishek Das
<abhishek.das@semolinakitchens.com>; Suman JHA <suman.jha@semolinakitchens.com>; Ameet.Koomar
<Ameet.Koomar@adani.com>; Lovejot Sekhon Kcorp <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>

Subject: RE: Material readiness for Trivandrum

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments
unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Mr. Ramendra,

We are ok to refund excess payment once the supply is done, however we would be required revised PO with GST
18% the execution.

Regards,

Gautam

From: Ramendra Singh <ramendra.singh@semolinakitchens.com>

Sent: Wednesday, November 27, 2024 11:57 AM

To: Gautam <ggautam@westernequipments.com>; 'Surajit Banerjee' <bsurajit@westernequipments.com>

Cc: Ebrahim Anis Shaikh <ebrahim.shaikh@semolinakitchens.com>; Sandeep Bhat K-Corp <sandeep.bhat@k-
corp.in>; 'Shashikant Vishwakarma' <shashikant.vishwakarma@k-corp.in>; Abhishek Das
<abhishek.das@semolinakitchens.com>; Suman JHA <suman.jha@semolinakitchens.com>; Ameet.Koomar

4



<Ameet.Koomar@adani.com>; Lovejot Sekhon Kcorp <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>
Subject: RE: Material readiness for Trivandrum

CAUTION : This Email originated from outside of the organization. Please do not open attachments or click
links from an unknown or suspicious origin.

Dear Gautam ji,

As per discussion with our finance team please Proceed invoice with 18% GST & balance 10% refund to the below
given Account
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Thanks & Regards,

Ramendra Singh

9999118677



From: Gautam <ggautam@westernequipments.com>

Sent: 27 November 2024 10:20

To: Ramendra Singh <ramendra.singh@semolinakitchens.com>; 'Surajit Banerjee'
<bsurajit@westernequipments.com>

Cc: Ebrahim Anis Shaikh <ebrahim.shaikh@semolinakitchens.com>; Sandeep Bhat K-Corp <sandeep.bhat@k-
corp.in>; 'Shashikant Vishwakarma' <shashikant.vishwakarma@k-corp.in>

Subject: RE: Material readiness for Trivandrum

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments
unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Mr. Ramendra,

Please provide revised PO with GST 18% instead 28%

3 ] 230 [2000R [2000R [Fo1 | 1.00] NOS | 84.550.00] 0.00] 84,950.00 | £4,950.00 |

VERTICAL VERTICAL
CHILLER plus CHILLER+FREE
FREEZER ZER
COMBINATION COMBINATION
- 55 2 Door HRFANHTTMS4

Regards,

Gautam

From: Ramendra Singh <ramendra.singh@semolinakitchens.com>

Sent: Friday, November 22, 2024 6:03 PM

To: 'Surajit Banerjee' <bsurajit@westernequipments.com™>; Gautam <ggautam@westernequipments.com>

Cc: Ebrahim Anis Shaikh <ebrahim.shaikh@semolinakitchens.com>; Sandeep Bhat K-Corp <sandeep.bhat@k-
corp.in>; Shashikant Vishwakarma <shashikant.vishwakarma@k-corp.in>

Subject: Material readiness for Trivandrum

CAUTION : This Email originated from outside of the organization. Please do not open attachments or click
links from an unknown or suspicious origin.

Dear Surjit ji,



Please find attached PO & below UTR detail, Kindly keep material ready for dispatch

Once the material is ready for pickup kindly inform us ASAP

Instrument Instrument Status UTR/RRN Srno/ IFT Beneficiary Descr
Date Amount Ref No. y

22-Nov-24 300958.00 Processed CMS3272465359609 WESTERN REFRIGERATION |

Thanks & Regards,
Ramendra Singh

9999118677

DISCLAIMER:

The information contained in this electronic message (email) and any attachments to this
email are intended for the exclusive use

of the addressee(s) and access to this email by any one else is unauthorized. The email
may contain proprietary, confidential or

privileged information or information relating to Western Refrigeration Pvt. Ltd (WRL
Group) .If you are not the intended recipient,

please notify the sender by telephone, fax, or return email and delete this communication
and any attachments thereto, immediately

from your computer. Any dissemination, distribution, or copying of this communication
and the attachments thereto (in whole or part),

in any manner,is strictly prohibited and actionable at law. The recipient acknowledges
that emails are susceptible to alteration and

their integrity can not be guaranteed and that Company does not guarantee that any e-
mail is virus-free and accept no liability for

any damage caused by any virus transmitted by this email.
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