Ramendra Singh

From: Mallesh Kalar <mallesh.shreeajaneyaent@gmail.com>
Sent: 11 September 2024 18:42

To: Nikhil Rane

Cc: Ramendra Singh

Subject: Re: Pasta station CLIP ON repairing work.

You don't often get email from mallesh.shreeajaneyaent@gmail.com. Learn why this is important

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the
sender and know the content is safe.

ok agree with the 5% discount.

Best Regards Faithfully

Shree Anjaneya Enterprises

Mallesh Kalar

Plot No.303, Room No. 10, Road NO.16,
Jawahar Nagar, Goregaon (W), Mumbai - 400104
Mob:-9869998535

On Wed, Sep 11, 2024 at 6:28 PM Mallesh Kalar <mallesh.shreeajaneyaent(@gmail.com> wrote:
ok agree with the 5% discount.

Best Regards Faithfully

Shree Anjaneya Enterprises

Mallesh Kalar

Plot No0.303, Room No. 10, Road NO.16,



Jawahar Nagar, Goregaon (W), Mumbai - 400104
Mob:-9869998535

On Wed, Sep 11, 2024 at 6:24 PM Nikhil Rane <nikhil.rane@travelfoodservices.com> wrote:

Dear Mallesh,

As discussed PO will be made with 5% discount against the quoted amount in your quotation.

Please share your confirmation for the same.

Thanks & Regards,

Nikhil Rane

Assistant Manager-Maintenance.
Mob: +91 8108794093

Email Id :- nikhil.rane@travelfoodservices.com

Website: www.travelfoodservices.com




