Mrunal Joshi

From: Anil Ahuja <apcmumbai@gmail.com>

Sent: 07 September 2024 10:47

To: Mrunal Joshi

Cc: Amit Tiwari; Ravi Jha; Binu Balachandran

Subject: Re: Ventillation work- CC Vlviana Thane- APC Alr Control
Dear Sir

We acknowledge the receipt of your PO and accept the same
The Payment terms will be same as earlier PO

85 % Payment Advance

Balance after completion

All Payments should be made along with GST Component

Thanks & Regards
Rajvinder
APC Air Control

On Fri, Sep 6, 2024 at 11:04 PM Mrunal Joshi <mrunal.joshi@k-corp.in> wrote:

Dear Rajvinder ji,

PFA the draft PO after 5% additional discount, as we discsussed.

Kindly check & acknowledge the same here to proceed further.

Best Regards,
Mr. Mrunal Joshi.

+91 83908 13805
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