Swapnil Sutar

From: Bhanu <ethya.tech@gmail.com>

Sent: 19 November 2024 13:45

To: Swapnil Sutar

Subject: Re: Need Water tanks KAPCO-2425-0042- CATERING COLLECTIVE -Delhi-Araya Bagh
Hi swapnil

Please find the rate for water tanks

Syntex Water Tank ( Black ) 3000 L

28500/- plus gst 18% including freight

On Mon, Nov 18, 2024 at 6:17 PM Swapnil Sutar <swapnil.sutar@k-corp.in> wrote:

Dear Partner,

Please quote for water tanks for Kapco

Syntex Water Tank ( Black ) 3000 L

Thanks & Regards,

Swapnil Sutar
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