Swapnil Sutar

From: ravikant goyal <ravikant.goyal1983@gmail.com>

Sent: 22 August 2024 17:08

To: care shri hitech; Swapnil Sutar

Subject: Re: Need RO Plant for Hyderabad Outlet

Attachments: Travel Food.xlsx; pan card.pdf; Cancel Cheque 2181.pdf; SHTIPL GST_Certificate-1.pdf; MSME Registration (2) (4).pdf
Dear sir,

Please view our estimated cost. request to please make PO as per given detail. Also we attach our VRF Document.

Company Name - Shri Hitech India Pvt Ltd
Address - MB1204, Shri Radha Velly NH 2 Mathura 281004.

Regards
Ravikant Goyal
Shri Hitech India Pvt Ltd

On Sat, Aug 17, 2024 at 3:19 PM care shri hitech <care@shrihitech.in> wrote:
FYI

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Swapnil Sutar <swapnil.sutar@k-corp.in>

Date: Sat, Aug 17, 2024 at 1:32 PM

Subject: RE: Need RO Plant for Hyderabad Outlet

To: vishal.khandelwal@shrihitech.in <vishal.khandelwal@shrihitech.in>, care@shrihitech.in <care@shrihitech.in>, Ravikant.goval@ 1983 gmail.com
<Ravikant.goyal@1983gmail.com>

Cc: Sandeep Bhat <sandeep.bhat@k-corp.in>, Abdul Rehman <abdul.rehman@k-corp.in>, Smrutika Thoti <smrutika.thoti@travelfoodservices.com>

Hi Lavish /Ravikant,

As discussed , kindly arrange the RO Plant on rental basis as well as water tank & Booster pump as per below.
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Thanks & Regards,

Swapnil Sutar
H | & +919987022136

Travel Food Services Pvt. Limited.

From: Swapnil Sutar

Sent: 17 August 2024 12:33

To: 'vishal.khandelwal@shrihitech.in' <vishal.khandelwal@shrihitech.in>

Cec: Sandeep Bhat <sandeep.bhat@k-corp.in>; Abdul Rehman <abdul.rehman@k-corp.in>; 'Smrutika Thoti' <smrutika.thoti@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: RE: Need RO Plant for Hyderabad Outlet

Dear Vishal,

Kindly arrange the balance RO plant on or before 20™ Aug 2024.



OUTLET NAME DESCRIPTION Ro plant capacity Water Tank capacity Booster pump
RO Plant Delivery with Automatic Pressure Pump — 1
Land Side Kitchen Installation 100 LPH — RO plant — 1 no. - 500 Litre Food grade Water Tank - | HP
RO Plant Delivery with
Chai Point Arrival Installation 50 Ltrs Hr - Flow Rate NA NA
RO Plant Delivery with
Installation RO Plant
As per attached image
RO + Alkaline + Silver Nano
Technology
7 Stage Filtration
10 Ltr. Storage
18 Ltr. Hr. Capacity
MOD LED indication NA NA
RO Plant Delivery with 25ltr — RO plant — 1 no. 200 Litre Food grade Water
Subway International Installation Tank - Automatic Pressure Pump — 1
RO Plant Delivery with
Air Side Kitchen Installation 25 LPH — RO plant— 1 no NA NA
RO Plant Delivery with SITC of Eco smart RO
Installation 50 LPH Capacity with all
Dhaba required accessories
Pizza Hut RO Plant Delivery with
International Installation RO Plant (150 LPH) RO Tank - 300 NA
OUTLET NAME DESCRIPTION Ro plant capacity Water Tank capacity Booster pump
RO Plant Delivery with
Carls Junior Installation 100 LPH 500 Litres Tank 1 HP Booster Pump
RO Plant Delivery with
Irish House Installation 200 LPH 500 Litres Tank 1 HP Booster Pump

/]

Thanks & Regards,



Swapnil Sutar
| & +919987022136

Travel Food Services Pvt. Limited.

From: Swapnil Sutar
Sent: 12 August 2024 18:20
To: 'vishal.khandelwal@shrihitech.in' <vishal. khandelwal@

An>
Cec: Sandeep Bhat <sandeep.bhat@k-corp.in>; Abdul Rehman <abdul.rehman@k-corp.in>; 'Smrutika Thoti' <smrutika.thoti@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: Need RO Plant for Hyderabad Outlet

Dear Sir,

Dear Vishal,

As discussed, kindly arrange the delivery

1) Chai point 26 ...



RO Plant - RO machine with SOLPH 12L capacity and it is usually fixed to the wall with a direct water connection as per attached image

2) HYD Air side Kitchen

RO Plant - 25 LPH

3) HYD Landside Kitchen

100 LPH — RO plant
500 Litre Food grade Water Tank

Automatic Pressure Pump — 1 HP

4) HYD FF 19 Subway
251tr — RO plant — 1 no. 200 Litre Food grade Water Tank

Automatic Pressure Pump — 1

Address Warehouse , Sai Sadhana Studios GMR Hospitality Limited , Dry Warehouse,SY no. 19
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Kavvapally Road,Ammatall Vill ,Shamshabad MandalTelangana, 500108

Contact details. Vinod -8879422855

Regards,

Swapnil Sutar

Thanks & Regards,

Swapnil Sutar

EH | & +919987022136



Travel Food Services Pvt. Limited.



