TV Martech CD INFOWARE LAKSH IT Solutions CD INFOWARE L1 Remarks
Sr. No |ltem Specifications uoMm Qty |[Rate [Amount Rate Amount Rate Amount Rate Amount
Samsung 32inch High End Professional Display 4K
Mainstream Proff Display for AVSI & Digital
Signage Project with Crystal Processor 4K/
1 Samsung 32inch TV Boundless Design/ Dynamic Crystal Color/3 Bezel Nos 3 23700.00 71100.00 22750.00 68250.00 24900.00 74700.00 21650.00 | 64950.00
less/ Stereo Mini Jack/ HDMI / USB / RS232C(in)
thru stereo jack, RJ45/Built-in-Speakers/ Haze
coating/ Tizen 4.0, Warranty-3Year, Make: Samsung
we are going with
. . the dell model
24 inch screen with
2 Nos 3 8000.00 24000.00 14500.00 43500.00 16500.00 49500.00 13900.00 | 41700.00 | becouse L1 vendor
usb port provide this price
chaina maodel
Basic Amount 95100.00 111750.00 124200.00 106650.00
packing charge 4% 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
packing charge total 95100.00 111750.00 124200.00 106650.00
GST Amount : 18% 17118.00 20115.00 22356.00 19197.00
Sub Total Amount 112218.00 131865.00 146556.00 125847.00




December 3, 2024

Ref.: CDI/TFSPL/1224 -125a

M/s. Travel Foods Services Pvt Ltd

Mumbai Airport

Kind Atten : Ms. Sonali

Subject: - Final Quotation for Commercial Monitor

Dear Sir,

C CP Infoware

Thank you very much for your enquiry. Further to your mail, we are pleased to offer the
following commercial.

;l: Product Description Qty | Rate/Unit | Total
1 Samsung QM32C Monitor - OS Tizan 7.0 | 3 21650 64950
2 | Dell P2425HE Monitor - USB- C port 3 13900 41700

Total 106650
GST@18% 19197
Total 125847

Terms & Conditions:

GST : 18% extra
Payment terms — 100% advance with Purchase Order
Delivery :- Within 1-2 Week after confirm PO.

Freight charges

:- Included for Mumbai Airport.

NE D=

Offer valid only 7 days

Thanks & Regards,
For CD Infoware

Vaishali

225, Prabhadevi Unique Ind. Estate,
Off Veer Savarkar Marg,
Prabhadevi, Mumbai - 400 025.
Tel. +91 22 24325589
Telefax. +91 22 24324390
www.cdinfoware.com



Sonali Dhadve

From: Vaishali Temghare <vaishali@cdinfoware.com>

Sent: Wednesday, December 4, 2024 4:26 PM

To: Herambraj Sonawane; Sonali Dhadve

Cc: Shashikant Vishwakarma; Cdinfotech-Manisha

Subject: Re: Samsung 32inch High End Professional

Attachments: Mumbai AIRPORT - Final quotation for Monitor.pdf; specifications.xlsx
Hi Sir,

Attached herewith is the Final Quotation for Samsung 32" Monitor.

Best Regards,

Vaishali

Board: +91-22-6615 2040 / 6615 2041 / 6615 2042 / 6615 2043 ( } cpl lh‘fﬂ'ﬂarﬂ

225 Prabhadevi Unigue Ind. Estate, OFf Veer Savarkar Marg, Prabhadevi, Mumbai - 400 025.
Email: vaishali@cdinfoware.com | Web : www.cdinfoware_com

k; .-L_'_/ =
FPrint this mad anly If absolutely necessary. Save Paper. Save Trees.’
any attachments) rm contain confidential, proprietary ar |
g recipient. The rac 1 ecknowledges that cd Infoware. are unabée to exerclsse c
ained in e-mall tranamigsions and no bind nature of the message shall be Implad
Belore opening any afttachments please check them for viruses and detacls.

On 02-12-2024 17:20, Vaishali Temghare wrote:

prvileged information. It should not be used nyodes wihd (8 not the onigins
| or endEUre or guaranbese on the inbegty offo contents of the infonmaton
ar assumead unless the sendar does so expressly with due suthority of cd Infoware.

mall message {inchs

Thits

Hi Sir,

Attached herewith is the Quotation for Samsung 32" Monitor.



Best Regards,

Vaishali

Board: +31-22-6615 2040 / 6615 2041 / 6615 2042 7 6615 2043 ( ) cv lh’fUWﬂrB

225, Prabhadevi Unique Ind. Estate, Off Veer Savarkar Marg, Prabhadevi, Mumbai - 400 025.
Email: vaishali@cdinfoware.com | Web : www. cdinfoware_com

-
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Frnt this maa only If absolutely necessary. Save Faper. Save Trees.”

Thia e-mall message (includng any attachments) may contain confidential, proprietary or legally privileged information. It showld not be used by anyone wha 8 not the origina
Intemded racipient. The recipient scknowledges that od Infoware. are wnable bo exercise control or ensEure or guarantee on the Inbegnty olfover the contents of the Inkonma boa
contained in e-mall tranemissions and no binding nature of the message shall be iImghed or assumed unless the sendar does o expressly with due suthority of cd infoware.
Before opening any attachments phease chieck them for viruses and defects.

On 02-12-2024 15:11, Herambraj Sonawane wrote:

Reminder

Thanks & Regards
Heramb

9702415737

From: Herambraj Sonawane

Sent: Saturday, November 30, 2024 2:56 PM

To: Sonali Dhadve <Sonali.dhadve@k-corp.in>; Herambraj Sonawane <mumbai.purchasel@k-corp.in>
Cc: Shashikant Vishwakarma <shashikant.vishwakarma@k-corp.in>

Subject: Samsung 32inch High End Professional

Dear Team
Kindly find below specs and provide quote

Delivery location — Mumbai skpl T2

sr.no name size QTyY




Samsung 32inch High End Professional
Display 4K Mainstream Proff Display for
AVSI & Digital Signage Project with Crystal
Processor 4K/ Boundless Design/ Dynamic Crystal Color/3

1 Bezel less/ Stereo Mini Jack/ 32"inch
HDMI / USB / RS232C(in) thru stereo jack, RJ45/Built-in-
Speakers/ Haze coating/ Tizen 4.0, Warranty-3Year, Make:
Samsung
2 24 inch screen with usb port 24"inch
Jdhanks & cRegards
8on.aliop




Sonali D

hadve

From:
Sent:
To:

Cc:
Subject:

Nitin Singhal <nitins@laksh.info>

Tuesday, December 3, 2024 1:23 PM
Herambraj Sonawane; Sonali Dhadve
Shashikant Vishwakarma

RE: Samsung 32inch High End Professional

Dear Herambraj,

Please find below proposal.
SI. o ,
No. Description/ltem QTY | Price | Amount
Samsung 32" QM32R Digital Signage
1 https://www.samsung.com/us/business/support/owners/product/qmr- 3 |24900 | 74700
series-digital-signage-qm32r/
2 | Dell Ultra Series TFT U2424H 3 16500 | 49500
GST Extra
Thanks & Regards

"oVl

Nitin Singhal

LAKSH IT Solutions & Security Systems Pvt Ltd
An ISO 9001:2008 Certified Co.

Ph. 011-35609550

f;

LAKSH (g -09312252563,09717627999

From: Herambraj Sonawane [mailto:mumbai.purchasel@k-corp.in]
Sent: 02 December 2024 15:12

To: Son

ali Dhadve <Sonali.dhadve@k-corp.in>

Cc: Shashikant Vishwakarma <shashikant.vishwakarma@k-corp.in>
Subject: RE: Samsung 32inch High End Professional




Reminder

Thanks & Regards
Heramb

9702415737

From: Herambraj Sonawane

Sent: Saturday, November 30, 2024 2:56 PM

To: Sonali Dhadve <Sonali.dhadve@k-corp.in>; Herambraj Sonawane <mumbai.purchasel@k-corp.in>
Cc: Shashikant Vishwakarma <shashikant.vishwakarma@k-corp.in>

Subject: Samsung 32inch High End Professional

Dear Team
Kindly find below specs and provide quote

Delivery location — Mumbai skpl T2

sr. no name size Qry
Samsung 32inch High End Professional
Display 4K Mainstream Proff Display for
AVS| & Digital Signage Project with Crystal
Processor 4K/ Boundless Design/ Dynamic Crystal Color/3

1 Bezel less/ Stereo Mini Jack/ 32"inch 3
HDMI / USB / RS232C(in) thru stereo jack, RJ45/Built-in-
Speakers/ Haze coating/ Tizen 4.0, Warranty-3Year, Make:
Samsung
2 24 inch screen with usb port 24"inch 3
dhanks & cRegards
Sonali D
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WErGEER

Matchless Quality & Ultimate Service

MSS/WM/KT-0299/24
November 30, 2024

WOow MOMOS
Delhi

Sub.: Offer for Samsung LFD Screens for your store Mumbai store.

Dear Sir,

Greetings from Martech, New Delhi

We thank you for your keen interest in our Samsung range LFD Screens. This is further to our
discussions, as desired, we are pleased to submit our very best offer for your requirement as

follows:
PRICE SCHEDULE

S. No.

Unit Tax

Description Size Qty. Prices

Price(Rs)

Samsung 32inch High End Professional
Display 4K Mainstream Proff Display for
AVSI & Digital Signage Project with Crystal
Processor 4K/ Boundless Design/ Dynamic
Crystal Color/3 Bezel less/ Stereo Mini Jack/| 32" 03No. | 23,700.00 | 4,266.00 83,898.00
HDMI / USB / RS232C(in) thru stereo jack,
RJ45/Built-in-Speakers/ Haze coating/ Tizen
4.0,

Warranty-3Year, Make: Samsung

24inch screen with USB port 24 03No. 8,000.00 1,440.00 9,440.00

Terms & Conditions:

* GST Including.

* Delivery: Within 2-3 weeks from the date of receipt of confirmed PO alongwith advance.

* Any Cabeling or job work (Civil or Electrical), other then supplied along with the Equipments is
out of our scope of supply. However all site conditions would be provided on Order
confirmation.

* Payment: 100% advance.

* For any Non-Standard Site Installation, the charges would be applicable extra based on site
condition.

* No Physical Damages at the time of Installation would be acceptable. Kindly test the material

at the time of receipt.
MARTECH SYSTEMS & SERVICES

605, Siddhartha Building Tel : +91-11- 42669999, 26417999 | E-mail : sales@martechindia.com
96, Nehru Place, New Delhi-110019 Fax: +91-11-26238940 Website: www.martechindia.com

APC Certified Authorised Service
@ = w " ® Centre & Solution Provider
by Schneider Electric

Branches in Nodia & Gurgaon
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WEreGEER

Matchless Quality & Ultimate Service

* All above prices are valid for a period of 10 days from the date of quotation.

We believe you would find our offer very competitive and very much in line with your
requirement. We assure you the very best of our services all the times. We would be pleased to
answer any kind of queries on these.

Thanking you and looking forward to a long and fruitful association with your organization.

Best Regards,

Yours Truly,

For Martech Systems & Services

Kapil Tripathi
9555282626



