Rahul mens Uniforms Guru
Sr. No Iltem UuoM Qty Rate Amount Rates Amount
1 jali cap for chef Nos 200 90.00 18000.00 110.00 22000.00
Basic Amount 18000.00 22000.00
GST Amount : 5% 900.00 1100.00
Sub Total Amount 18900.00 23100.00




Sonali Dhadve

From: Uniforms Guru <uniformsguru@gmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, September 10, 2024 11:29 AM

To: Sonali Dhadve <Sonali.dhadve @k-corp.in>

Cc: Santosh Sawant <santosh.sawant@k-corp.in>

Subject: Re: FW: E-Sourcing : K Hospitality Corp :: Purchase Request for PR NO : TFSKPL-2425-00113 and chef cap

Please check Chef Jali Rate

Line No | Item Code | Item Name |(UOM/| Qty | Unit Price | Net Amount
1 jali cap for chef | NOS |200.00| 110 22000

On Tue, 10 Sept 2024 at 11:22, Sonali Dhadve <Sonali.dhadve@k-corp.in> wrote:

Hello,

Please check requirement and share quotation.

Line No | Item Code | Item Name |UOM/| Qty | Unit Price | Net Amount
1 jali cap for chef | NOS |200.00 | 0.00 0.00




Jhanks & Regards
8on.al£ OD

From: Arup Munshi <arup.munshi@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: Tuesday, September 10, 2024 7:52 AM

To: Sonali Dhadve <Sonali.dhadve@k-corp.in>

Cc: Priyoranjan Thoi <priyoranjan.thoi@k-corp.in>; Abhishek Prasad <abhishek.prasad@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: Re: E-Sourcing : K Hospitality Corp :: Purchase Request for PR NO : TFSKPL-2425-00113 and chef cap

Dear Sonali,

As per trail mail please find the attached chef cap pictures for your reference.

Regards

Arup Munshi

Sent from Qutlook for Android

From: Sonali Dhadve <Sonali.dhadve@k-corp.in>
Sent: Monday, September 9, 2024 1:20:28 PM




To: Arup Munshi <arup.munshi@travelfoodservices.com>
Cc: Priyoranjan Thoi <priyoranjan.thoi@k-corp.in>
Subject: RE: E-Sourcing : K Hospitality Corp :: Purchase Request for PR NO : TFSKPL-2425-00113 and chef cap

You don't often get email from sonali.dhadve@k-corp.in. Learn why this is important

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Hello Arup,

Please share images below mention iteam.

Line No | Item Code | Item Name |UOM/| Qty | Unit Price | Net Amount
1 jali cap for chef | NOS |200.00 | 0.00 0.00

Jhanks & cRegards

Sonali ﬁ



From: Priyoranjan Thoi <priyoranjan.thoi@k-corp.in>

Sent: Friday, September 6, 2024 9:24 PM

To: Sonali Dhadve <Sonali.dhadve@k-corp.in>

Cc: Arup Munshi <arup.munshi@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: Re: E-Sourcing : K Hospitality Corp :: Purchase Request for PR NO : TFSKPL-2425-00113 and chef cap

Arup pls provide

Regs,

PRT

From: Sonali Dhadve <Sonali.dhadve @k-corp.in>

Sent: Friday, September 6, 2024 5:38:38 PM

To: Priyoranjan Thoi <priyoranjan.thoi@k-corp.in>

Subject: RE: E-Sourcing : K Hospitality Corp :: Purchase Request for PR NO : TFSKPL-2425-00113 and chef cap

Hello,

but I still need the image.



dhanks & cRegards

Sonali ﬁ

From: Priyoranjan Thoi <priyoranjan.thoi@k-corp.in>

Sent: Friday, September 6, 2024 4:43 PM

To: Sonali Dhadve <Sonali.dhadve@k-corp.in>

Cc: PERWEZ AHMED <sktailors4du@gmail.com>

Subject: RE: E-Sourcing : K Hospitality Corp :: Purchase Request for PR NO : TFSKPL-2425-00113 and chef cap

Perwez does not supply jali cap
Regs,

Priyo Ranjan Thoi

Travel Food Services

ps.

e e b

From: Sonali Dhadve <Sonali.dhadve @k-corp.in>

Sent: 06 September 2024 04:34 PM

To: Priyoranjan Thoi <priyoranjan.thoi@k-corp.in>

Cc: PERWEZ AHMED <sktailors4u@gmail.com>

Subject: RE: E-Sourcing : K Hospitality Corp :: Purchase Request for PR NO : TFSKPL-2425-00113 and chef cap




Hello Priyoranjan,

Please share images

Line No | Item Code | Item Name |(UOM/| Qty | Unit Price | Net Amount
1 jali cap for chef | NOS |200.00 | 0.00 0.00

dhanks & cRegards

8on.ali op

From: no-reply@procuresens.com <no-reply@procuresens.com>
Sent: Monday, August 26, 2024 7:03 PM

To: Sonali Dhadve <Sonali.dhadve@k-corp.in>
Subject: E-Sourcing : K Hospitality Corp :: Purchase Request for PR NO : TFSKPL-2425-00113 and chef cap

Dear Sonali Dhadve,

New Purchase Request is assigned to you. Below are the details

PR Details as below :



PR Number: TFSKPL-2425-00113

PR Description: chef cap

PR Total Amount: 0.00

Requested by: Arun Kanti Patra

Requested Date and Time: 26/08/2024 17:24:22
Approved Date and Time: 26/08/2024 17:41:48
Department: SDepartment$

List of PR Line Items

. Unit Net
Line No Item Code Item Name UOM Qty Price | Amount
1 jali cap for chef NOS 200.00 0.00 [0.00

E-Procurement System

Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail.This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this email ID.

Thanking You,
Rahul Mens Wear

9820477315



Sonali Dhadve

From: Pawan Pandey <pawanpandey681@gmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, September 10, 2024 11:29 AM

To: Sonali Dhadve

Cc: Santosh Sawant

Subject: Re: FW: E-Sourcing : K Hospitality Corp :: Purchase Request for PR NO : TFSKPL-2425-00113 and chef cap
Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Flagged

CHEF JALI CAP RATE 9o /-

On Tue, 10 Sept 2024 at 11:22, Sonali Dhadve <Sonali.dhadve@k-corp.in> wrote:

Hello,

Please check requirement and share quotation.

Line No | Item Code | Item Name |(UOM/| Qty | Unit Price | Net Amount
1 jali cap for chef | NOS |200.00 | 0.00 0.00

dhanks & cRegards

8on.al£ OD



From: Arup Munshi <arup.munshi@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: Tuesday, September 10, 2024 7:52 AM

To: Sonali Dhadve <Sonali.dhadve@k-corp.in>

Cc: Priyoranjan Thoi <priyoranjan.thoi@k-corp.in>; Abhishek Prasad <abhishek.prasad@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: Re: E-Sourcing : K Hospitality Corp :: Purchase Request for PR NO : TFSKPL-2425-00113 and chef cap

Dear Sonali,

As per trail mail please find the attached chef cap pictures for your reference.

Regards

Arup Munshi

Sent from Qutlook for Android

From: Sonali Dhadve <Sonali.dhadve @k-corp.in>

Sent: Monday, September 9, 2024 1:20:28 PM

To: Arup Munshi <arup.munshi@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Priyoranjan Thoi <priyoranjan.thoi@k-corp.in>

Subject: RE: E-Sourcing : K Hospitality Corp :: Purchase Request for PR NO : TFSKPL-2425-00113 and chef cap




You don't often get email from sonali.dhadve@k-corp.in. Learn why this is important

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Hello Arup,

Please share images below mention iteam.

Line No | Item Code | Item Name |UOM/| Qty | Unit Price | Net Amount
1 jali cap for chef | NOS |200.00 | 0.00 0.00

Jhanks & cRegards

Sonali ﬁ

From: Priyoranjan Thoi <priyoranjan.thoi@k-corp.in>
Sent: Friday, September 6, 2024 9:24 PM
To: Sonali Dhadve <Sonali.dhadve@k-corp.in>




Cc: Arup Munshi <arup.munshi@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: Re: E-Sourcing : K Hospitality Corp :: Purchase Request for PR NO : TFSKPL-2425-00113 and chef cap

Arup pls provide

Regs,

PRT

From: Sonali Dhadve <Sonali.dhadve @k-corp.in>

Sent: Friday, September 6, 2024 5:38:38 PM

To: Priyoranjan Thoi <priyoranjan.thoi@k-corp.in>

Subject: RE: E-Sourcing : K Hospitality Corp :: Purchase Request for PR NO : TFSKPL-2425-00113 and chef cap

Hello,

but I still need the image.

Jhanks & cRegards

Sonali ﬁ



From: Priyoranjan Thoi <priyoranjan.thoi@k-corp.in>

Sent: Friday, September 6, 2024 4:43 PM

To: Sonali Dhadve <Sonali.dhadve@k-corp.in>

Cc: PERWEZ AHMED <sktailors4u@gmail.com>

Subject: RE: E-Sourcing : K Hospitality Corp :: Purchase Request for PR NO : TFSKPL-2425-00113 and chef cap

Perwez does not supply jali cap
Regs,

Priyo Ranjan Thoi

Travel Food Services

e

= ey

From: Sonali Dhadve <Sonali.dhadve @k-corp.in>

Sent: 06 September 2024 04:34 PM

To: Priyoranjan Thoi <priyoranjan.thoi@k-corp.in>

Cc: PERWEZ AHMED <sktailors4du@gmail.com>

Subject: RE: E-Sourcing : K Hospitality Corp :: Purchase Request for PR NO : TFSKPL-2425-00113 and chef cap

Hello Priyoranjan,



Please share images

Line No | Item Code | Item Name |UOM/| Qty | Unit Price | Net Amount
1 jali cap for chef | NOS |200.00 | 0.00 0.00

Jdhanks G (R_egatds
Sonali ﬁ

From: no-reply@procuresens.com <no-reply@procuresens.com>

Sent: Monday, August 26, 2024 7:03 PM

To: Sonali Dhadve <Sonali.dhadve@k-corp.in>

Subject: E-Sourcing : K Hospitality Corp :: Purchase Request for PR NO : TFSKPL-2425-00113 and chef cap

Dear Sonali Dhadve,
New Purchase Request is assigned to you. Below are the details

PR Details as below :
PR Number: TFSKPL-2425-00113
PR Description: chef cap



PR Total Amount: 0.00

Requested by: Arun Kanti Patra

Requested Date and Time: 26/08/2024 17:24:22
Approved Date and Time: 26/08/2024 17:41:48
Department: SDepartment$

List of PR Line Items

. Unit Net
Line No Item Code Item Name UOM Qty Price | Amount
1 jali cap for chef NOS 200.00 0.00 [0.00

E-Procurement System

HOSPITALITY

Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail.This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this email ID.

Thanking You,



Rahul Mens Wear

9820477315



