GROSS KITCHEN INTERNATIONAL
EQUIPMENTS EQUIPMENT
Sr. No ltem Description UuoM Qty Rate Amount Rates Amount
1 Nos 2 20500.00 | 41000.00 | 25200.00 | 50400.00
Basic Amount 41000.00 50400.00
GST Amount : 18% 7380.00 9072.00
Sub Total Amount 48380.00 59472.00




QUOTATION

>

GrossKirenenEQuipMenTs

G ROSS KITCH EN EQUIPM ENTS

G/78, GR. FLOOR, KOHINOOR MALL, KOHINOOR CITY, KIROL ROAD, KURLA WEST

MUMBAI 400 070. www.grosskitchenequipments.com

GSTIN No 27ASPPAOS02N1ZT

MISS SONALI DHAHDVE
M/s TRAVEL FOOD SERVICES PVT. LTD. QI NO. Dated
Rashid Mansion, Motilal Sanghi Rd, Shiv Sagar Estate, Worli, Mumbeai,
Maharashtra 400018
GKE-PI-1777 18-Sep-24
Sr. No. DESCRIPTION OF GOODS MAKE SIZE QTY RATE AMOUNT | GST RATE| GST AMOUNT | GRAND TOTAL
1 PLATFORM TROLLEY 36"X24"X36" 2 20500 41000.00 18% 7380.00 48380.00
0.00 18% 0.00 0.00
0.00 18% 0.00 0.00
0.00 18% 0.00 0.00
0.00 18% 0.00 0.00
0.00 18% 0.00 0.00
0.00 18% 0.00 0.00
0.00 18% 0.00 0.00
0.00 18% 0.00 0.00
0.00 18% 0.00 0.00
0.00 18% 0.00 0.00
0.00 18% 0.00 0.00
0.00 18% 0.00 0.00
0.00 18% 0.00 0.00
0.00 18% 0.00 0.00
Taxable Value 41000.00 48380.00
Transportation 0.00
GRAND TOTAL 48380.00

Payment Terms for Fabricated Equipments :- 100 % Advance .
Transportation:- Extra

Unloading & Matari:- By buyer

Warranty:- 12 month from the date of Delivery.

Delivery:- 15 Daye after receving Confirm Purchase Order, Approve Drawing & advance.

For Gross Kitchen Equipments
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Authorised Signatory




Sonali Dhadve

From: INTERNATIONAL EQUIPMENT CO.(SIMRAN) <info@iec-indulge.com>
Sent: Monday, July 22, 2024 11:28 AM

To: Sonali Dhadve

Cc: Santosh Sawant; Swapnil Sutar

Subject: RE: Trolley With Heavy Duty (GWH THE LOUNGE)

Dear Sonali,

Please find below our best price for your required item :

1. S.STrolley With Heavy Duty Wheels ( 36 *24 *36ht ) @ 25,200/~ Each
+ Packing + Freight + GST

BR

Simran

7011950881

International Equipment Co.

From: Sonali Dhadve <Sonali.dhadve @k-corp.in>

Sent: 20 July 2024 16:57

To: Sonali Dhadve <Sonali.dhadve@k-corp.in>

Cc: Santosh Sawant <santosh.sawant@k-corp.in>; Swapnil Sutar <swapnil.sutar@k-corp.in>
Subject: Trolley With Heavy Duty (GWH THE LOUNGE)

Hello,

Please see below requirement and share best rate of quotation



Line No Item Code Item Name uom Qty Ur.ut Net
Price | Amount
5.5 Trollev With H S.S Trolley With Heavy
1 " rot ey With fieavy Duty Wheels ( 36 *24 | NOS 2.00
uty Wheels
*36ht )
dhanks & ﬂ_egatdb

Sonali ﬁ




