Abdul Rehman

From: Pankaj Sakarkar <pankajsakarkar@bluestarindia.com>
Sent: 07 May 2024 12:59

To: Abdul Rehman

Cc: Sandeep Bhat; Swapnil Sutar

Subject: RE: ice machine - ICM90

Dear Abdul Ji,
Pls find below quote for ICM90.
ICM90 - 95000+ GST (With installation and other terms and conditions as per our RC)

Regards
Pankaj

From: Abdul Rehman [mailto:abdul.rehman@k-corp.in]
Sent: Tuesday, May 7, 2024 12:39 PM

Cc: Sandeep Bhat; Swapnil Sutar

Subject: ice machine - ICM90

CAUTION: ** This mail has been sent from outside Blue Star. Please open attachments/links after validating credentials. **
Dear Pankaj,

Request you to kindly share the quote for below machine for Jaipur Lounge

ice machine - ICM90

Thanks & Regards,

Abdul Rehman

E | & +919920292129
Travel Food Services Pvt. Limited.



