Abdul Rehman

From: Akshay Sharma <akshay.sharma@semolinakitchens.com>
Sent: 28 August 2024 11:17

To: Ashish Nagar; Stephen P; Lovejot Sekhon

Subject: RE: Quotation for Extra work at AJ 1881 Kitchens

Approved. Pls involve procurement team into it.

From: Ashish Nagar <ashish.nagar@travelfoodservices.com>
Sent: Monday, August 26, 2024 3:14 PM

To: Akshay Sharma <akshay.sharma@semolinakitchens.com>
Subject: FW: Quotation for Extra work at AJ 1881 Kitchens

Hi Sir

Please find the quote for AJ 1881 exhaust hood fabricating cost along with chamber
Grease trap quote costing is pending which will be received in 2-3 days

Kindly approve the quote so that vendor can start hood fabrication work

Regards
Ashish

From: Arihant Infracon <arihantinfracon.bom@gmail.com>
Sent: 24 August 2024 17:07

To: Ashish Nagar <ashish.nagar@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: Quotation for Extra work at AJ 1881 Kitchens

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Sir,
Please find quotation for Extra work at AJ Kitchen in the PDF Attached below.

Thanks & Regards.
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