Abdul Rehman

From: Abdul Rehman

Sent: 04 May 2024 14:18

To: Whitegloves Inc

Cc: Sandeep Bhat; Swapnil Sutar
Subject: RE: Dilli Street Requirement
HI Ritesh Ji,

As discussed with you we are going ahead with the rate of Rs 485000 + GST + installation.

Thanks & Regards,

Abdul Rehman

H | & +919920292129

Travel Food Services Pvt. Limited.

From: Whitegloves Inc <whiteglovesincinfo@gmail.com>

Sent: 04 May 2024 10:06

To: Abdul Rehman <abdul.rehman@k-corp.in>

Cc: Sandeep Bhat <sandeep.bhat@k-corp.in>; Swapnil Sutar <swapnil.sutar@k-corp.in>
Subject: Fwd: Dilli Street Requirement

Dear Sir,

Please find the attached offer of Gas Range with oven.

Warm Regards,

WhiteGleves®

Brings value to you

Ritessh Kausshik

+91-9643305236

WhiteGloves Company Inc.
#624-D,Zero Number Road, Ghitorni,
New Delhi-110030, India

Ccare-93 541 63 925



Electrolux

PROFESSIONAL

Authorised Business Partner Authorised Business Partner

Forwarded message ---------

From: Abdul Rehman <abdul.rehman@k-corp.in>
Date: Fri, 3 May 2024, 12:06

Subject: Dilli Street Requirement

To: whiteglovesincservice@gmail.com <whiteglovesincservice@gmail.com>

Cc: Sandeep Bhat <sandeep.bhat@k-corp.in>, Swapnil Sutar <swapnil.sutar@k-corp.in>

Dear Ritesh ji,

Please share the quote of below mentioned equipment

EQ SR.

No DESCRIPTION OVERALL SIZE  |Model No QTY
4 BURNER COOKING RANGE WITH OVEN 800 x 900 x 850+ [ELECTROLUX -

K-05 BELOW(ELECTRIC) 58 391041 1
4 BURNER COOKING RANGE WITH OVEN 800 x 900 x 850+ |ELECTROLUX -

K-07 BELOW(ELECTRIC) 58 391041 1

Thanks & Regards,

Abdul Rehman

H | & +919920292129




Travel Food Services Pvt. Limited.



