
1

Abdul Rehman

From: Manish  Mulchandani <Manish.Mulchandani@adani.com>
Sent: 20 November 2023 18:21
To: Stephen P; Rupali Pol
Cc: Shama Nair; Suraj Kumbhar; Trupti Dalvi; Nimisha Jadhav; Prakash Mistry; Khushbu Verma; Lovejot Sekhon; Binu Balachandran; Santosh Tambe; Utkarsh Singh; Avadhesh Kumar Singh; Sandeep Bhat; Kamal Saraf; Ansari Faheem Noor Hasan; Saeed Khan; Ameet Koomar; Chirag Shah; Awadhesh Kumar; Neha 

Bagrecha; Prathamesh Bhavsar; Ajit Yadav; Abdul Rehman; Avadhesh Kumar Singh; Swapnil Sutar; Jatin Jain; Saikat Pal
Subject: RE: AMD T1 FF II 02 Nos. Temporary Food truck Earmarked layout with  MEP requirements  at Wagamama Area Unit: L-38,39 
Attachments: AMD - Equipment - Mexican & Middle Eastern Cart.xlsx

Dear Stephen 
 
Please find below breakup as requested. 
 

Outlet Supplier Name 
Final Negotiated 

Amount 
GST 

Final Negotiated 
Amount with GST 

         

AMD-MEX 

Pretair System                     18,500                  3,330                         21,830  

Mital                    48,800                  8,784                         57,584  

Western Refrigeration Pvt Ltd.                    96,816                 17,427                       1,14,243  

Gross Kitchen Equipments                             -                          -                                   -    

International Equipment Co.                             -                          -                                   -    

Blue Star Limited                             -                          -                                   -    
         

AMD-MID 

Pretair System                    26,000                  4,680                        30,680  

Mital                             -                          -                                   -    

Western Refrigeration Pvt Ltd.                  1,06,332                 19,140                       1,25,472  

Gross Kitchen Equipments                    55,900                10,062                        65,962  

International Equipment Co.                    24,400                  4,392                         28,792  

Blue Star Limited                     12,500                  2,250                         14,750  
 
Regards, 
Manish Mulchandani 
 
 

From: Stephen P <stephen.p@k-corp.in>  
Sent: Monday, November 20, 2023 12:47 PM 
To: Manish Mulchandani <Manish.Mulchandani@adani.com>; Rupali Pol <rupali.pol@travelfoodservices.com> 
Cc: Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Suraj Kumbhar <suraj.kumbhar@travelfoodservices.com>; Trupti Dalvi <trupti.dalvi@travelfoodservices.com>; Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>; Prakash Mistry 
<prakash.mistry@travelfoodservices.com>; Khushbu Verma <khushbu.dayal@travelfoodservices.com>; Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>; Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>; Santosh Tambe 
<santosh.tambe@travelfoodservices.com>; Utkarsh Singh <Utkarsh.Singh@adani.com>; Avadhesh Kumar Singh <Avadhesh.Kumar@adani.com>; Sandeep Bhat <sandeep.bhat@travelfoodservices.com>; Kamal Saraf <kamal.saraf@k-corp.in>; Ansari 
Faheem Noor Hasan <faheem.ansari@travelfoodservices.com>; Saeed Khan <saeed.khan@travelfoodservices.com>; Ameet Koomar <Ameet.Koomar@adani.com>; Chirag Shah <Chirag.Shah1@adani.com>; Awadhesh Kumar 
<Awadhesh.Kumar1@adani.com>; Neha Bagrecha <Neha.Bagrecha@adani.com>; Prathamesh Bhavsar <Prathamesh.Bhavsar@adani.com>; Ajit Yadav <ajit.yadav@travelfoodservices.com>; Abdul Rehman <abdul.rehman@k-corp.in>; Avadhesh Kumar 
Singh <Avadhesh.Kumar@adani.com>; Swapnil Sutar <swapnil.sutar@k-corp.in>; Jatin Jain <Jatin.Jain@adani.com>; Saikat Pal <Saikat.Pal@adani.com> 
Subject: RE: AMD T1 FF II 02 Nos. Temporary Food truck Earmarked layout with MEP requirements at Wagamama Area Unit: L-38,39  
 
*CAUTION: This mail has originated from outside Adani. Please exercise caution with links and attachments.* 
 
Dear Manish, 
 
As discussed, request you to share outlet wise commercials over mail body, as this is an requirement from our finance team in order to have the PO’s released. 
 
 
Regards 
Stephen 
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From: Manish Mulchandani <Manish.Mulchandani@adani.com>  
Sent: 11 November 2023 16:32 
To: Rupali Pol <rupali.pol@travelfoodservices.com>; Stephen P <stephen.p@k-corp.in> 
Cc: Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Suraj Kumbhar <suraj.kumbhar@travelfoodservices.com>; Trupti Dalvi <trupti.dalvi@travelfoodservices.com>; Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>; Prakash Mistry 
<prakash.mistry@travelfoodservices.com>; Khushbu Verma <khushbu.dayal@travelfoodservices.com>; Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>; Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>; Santosh Tambe 
<santosh.tambe@travelfoodservices.com>; Utkarsh Singh <Utkarsh.Singh@adani.com>; Avadhesh Kumar Singh <Avadhesh.Kumar@adani.com>; Sandeep Bhat <sandeep.bhat@travelfoodservices.com>; Stephen P <stephen.p@k-corp.in>; Kamal Saraf 
<kamal.saraf@k-corp.in>; Ansari Faheem Noor Hasan <faheem.ansari@travelfoodservices.com>; Saeed Khan <saeed.khan@travelfoodservices.com>; Ameet Koomar <Ameet.Koomar@adani.com>; Chirag Shah <Chirag.Shah1@adani.com>; Awadhesh 
Kumar <Awadhesh.Kumar1@adani.com>; Neha Bagrecha <Neha.Bagrecha@adani.com>; Prathamesh Bhavsar <Prathamesh.Bhavsar@adani.com>; Ajit Yadav <ajit.yadav@travelfoodservices.com>; Abdul Rehman <abdul.rehman@k-corp.in>; Avadhesh 
Kumar Singh <Avadhesh.Kumar@adani.com>; Swapnil Sutar <swapnil.sutar@k-corp.in>; Jatin Jain <Jatin.Jain@adani.com>; Saikat Pal <Saikat.Pal@adani.com> 
Subject: RE: AMD T1 FF II 02 Nos. Temporary Food truck Earmarked layout with MEP requirements at Wagamama Area Unit: L-38,39  
 
Dear Stephen 
  
With reference to subjected works, we hereby recommend below listed vendor for your further acƟon. 
 

A. Brought Out Items. 

Supplier Name 
Final Negotiated 

Amount 
GST 

Final Negotiated 
Amount with GST 

Remarks 

          

Pretair System                    44,500                  8,010                         52,510    

Mital                    48,800                  8,784                         57,584    

Western Refrigeration Pvt Ltd.                  2,03,148                36,567                       2,39,715    

Gross Kitchen Equipments                    55,900                10,062                        65,962    

International Equipment Co.                    24,400                  4,392                         28,792    

Blue Star Limited                     12,500                  2,250                         14,750    

          
 
TFS team must compare our recommended price with their existing/LPP price and in case of any price variation, kindly convey the same in order to reconsider that particular item.  
 
Regards, 
Manish Mulchandani 
 
 

From: Rupali Pol <rupali.pol@travelfoodservices.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, November 1, 2023 12:27 PM 
To: Santosh Tambe <santosh.tambe@travelfoodservices.com>; Manish Mulchandani <Manish.Mulchandani@adani.com>; Utkarsh Singh <Utkarsh.Singh@adani.com>; Avadhesh Kumar Singh <Avadhesh.Kumar@adani.com>; Sandeep Bhat 
<sandeep.bhat@travelfoodservices.com> 
Cc: Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Suraj Kumbhar <suraj.kumbhar@travelfoodservices.com>; Trupti Dalvi <trupti.dalvi@travelfoodservices.com>; Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>; Prakash Mistry 
<prakash.mistry@travelfoodservices.com>; Khushbu Verma <khushbu.dayal@travelfoodservices.com>; Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>; Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>; Stephen P <stephen.p@k-corp.in>; Kamal Saraf 
<kamal.saraf@k-corp.in>; Ansari Faheem Noor Hasan <faheem.ansari@travelfoodservices.com>; Saeed Khan <saeed.khan@travelfoodservices.com>; Ameet Koomar <Ameet.Koomar@adani.com>; Chirag Shah <Chirag.Shah1@adani.com>; Awadhesh 
Kumar <Awadhesh.Kumar1@adani.com>; Neha Bagrecha <Neha.Bagrecha@adani.com>; Prathamesh Bhavsar <Prathamesh.Bhavsar@adani.com>; Ajit Yadav <ajit.yadav@travelfoodservices.com>; Abdul Rehman <abdul.rehman@k-corp.in>; Avadhesh 
Kumar Singh <Avadhesh.Kumar@adani.com>; Swapnil Sutar <swapnil.sutar@k-corp.in> 
Subject: RE: AMD T1 FF II 02 Nos. Temporary Food truck Earmarked layout with MEP requirements at Wagamama Area Unit: L-38,39  
 
*CAUTION: This mail has originated from outside Adani. Please exercise caution with links and attachments.* 
 
Dear Manish , 
 
As discussed, our carts have already arrived at airport and vendor is doing the assembling work hence request you to close carts equipment as earliest . 
 
Thanks  
Rupali Pol 
 

From: Santosh Tambe <santosh.tambe@travelfoodservices.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, October 18, 2023 1:36 PM 
To: Manish Mulchandani <Manish.Mulchandani@adani.com>; Utkarsh Singh <Utkarsh.Singh@adani.com>; Avadhesh Kumar Singh <Avadhesh.Kumar@adani.com>; Sandeep Bhat <sandeep.bhat@travelfoodservices.com> 
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Cc: Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Rupali Pol <rupali.pol@travelfoodservices.com>; Suraj Kumbhar <suraj.kumbhar@travelfoodservices.com>; Trupti Dalvi <trupti.dalvi@travelfoodservices.com>; Nimisha Jadhav 
<nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>; Prakash Mistry <prakash.mistry@travelfoodservices.com>; Khushbu Verma <khushbu.dayal@travelfoodservices.com>; Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>; Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-
corp.in>; Stephen P <stephen.p@k-corp.in>; Kamal Saraf <kamal.saraf@k-corp.in>; Ansari Faheem Noor Hasan <faheem.ansari@travelfoodservices.com>; Saeed Khan <saeed.khan@travelfoodservices.com>; Ameet Koomar 
<Ameet.Koomar@adani.com>; Chirag Shah <Chirag.Shah1@adani.com>; Awadhesh Kumar <Awadhesh.Kumar1@adani.com>; Neha Bagrecha <Neha.Bagrecha@adani.com>; Prathamesh Bhavsar <Prathamesh.Bhavsar@adani.com>; Ajit Yadav 
<ajit.yadav@travelfoodservices.com>; Abdul Rehman <abdul.rehman@k-corp.in>; Avadhesh Kumar Singh <Avadhesh.Kumar@adani.com>; Swapnil Sutar <swapnil.sutar@k-corp.in> 
Subject: FW: AMD T1 FF II 02 Nos. Temporary Food truck Earmarked layout with MEP requirements at Wagamama Area Unit: L-38,39  
 
 
Dear Manish ,  
  
        Please find the aƩached details of equipment vendors as sent by Sandeep Bhat for Carts at Ahmedabad T1 SHA . 
 
Aside Sandeep -  Have requested for the drawing as asked by your goodself . 
 
 
Regards 
Santosh TAMBE  

From: Sandeep Bhat <sandeep.bhat@k-corp.in>  
Sent: 18 October 2023 12:32 
To: Santosh Tambe <santosh.tambe@travelfoodservices.com>; Manish Mulchandani <Manish.Mulchandani@adani.com>; Akshay Sharma <akshay.sharma@semolinakitchens.com>; Sandeep Bhat <sandeep.bhat@travelfoodservices.com> 
Cc: Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Rupali Pol <rupali.pol@travelfoodservices.com>; Suraj Kumbhar <suraj.kumbhar@travelfoodservices.com>; Trupti Dalvi <trupti.dalvi@travelfoodservices.com>; Nimisha Jadhav 
<nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>; Prakash Mistry <prakash.mistry@travelfoodservices.com>; Khushbu Verma <khushbu.dayal@travelfoodservices.com>; Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>; Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-
corp.in>; Stephen P <stephen.p@k-corp.in>; Kamal Saraf <kamal.saraf@k-corp.in>; Ansari Faheem Noor Hasan <faheem.ansari@travelfoodservices.com>; Saeed Khan <saeed.khan@travelfoodservices.com>; Ameet Koomar 
<Ameet.Koomar@adani.com>; Chirag Shah <Chirag.Shah1@adani.com>; Awadhesh Kumar <Awadhesh.Kumar1@adani.com>; Neha Bagrecha <Neha.Bagrecha@adani.com>; Prathamesh Bhavsar <Prathamesh.Bhavsar@adani.com>; Ajit Yadav 
<ajit.yadav@travelfoodservices.com>; Abdul Rehman <abdul.rehman@k-corp.in>; Avadhesh Kumar Singh <Avadhesh.Kumar@adani.com>; Swapnil Sutar <swapnil.sutar@k-corp.in> 
Subject: RE: AMD T1 FF II 02 Nos. Temporary Food truck Earmarked layout with MEP requirements at Wagamama Area Unit: L-38,39  
 
CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe. 

 
Santosh  
 
Please find the vendor /supplier details , Please provide SS fabricated equipment drawings for geƫng proper quotes for ex In MIDDLE EASTERN CART  COLD BAIN MARIE WITH  5Nos. 1/9 GN PAN WORKING SPACE drawings are required  
 
 

From: Santosh Tambe <santosh.tambe@travelfoodservices.com>  
Sent: 09 October 2023 17:00 
To: Manish Mulchandani <Manish.Mulchandani@adani.com>; Akshay Sharma <akshay.sharma@semolinakitchens.com>; Sandeep Bhat <sandeep.bhat@travelfoodservices.com> 
Cc: Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Rupali Pol <rupali.pol@travelfoodservices.com>; Suraj Kumbhar <suraj.kumbhar@travelfoodservices.com>; Trupti Dalvi <trupti.dalvi@travelfoodservices.com>; Nimisha Jadhav 
<nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>; Prakash Mistry <prakash.mistry@travelfoodservices.com>; Khushbu Verma <khushbu.dayal@travelfoodservices.com>; Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>; Sandeep Bhat <sandeep.bhat@k-corp.in>; 
Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>; Stephen P <stephen.p@k-corp.in>; Kamal Saraf <kamal.saraf@k-corp.in>; Ansari Faheem Noor Hasan <faheem.ansari@travelfoodservices.com>; Saeed Khan <saeed.khan@travelfoodservices.com>; 
Ameet Koomar <Ameet.Koomar@adani.com>; Chirag Shah <Chirag.Shah1@adani.com>; Awadhesh Kumar <Awadhesh.Kumar1@adani.com>; Neha Bagrecha <Neha.Bagrecha@adani.com>; Prathamesh Bhavsar <Prathamesh.Bhavsar@adani.com>; Ajit 
Yadav <ajit.yadav@travelfoodservices.com>; Avadhesh Kumar Singh <Avadhesh.Kumar@adani.com> 
Subject: RE: AMD T1 FF II 02 Nos. Temporary Food truck Earmarked layout with MEP requirements at Wagamama Area Unit: L-38,39  
 
Dear Manish , 
 
       Please find aƩached the Equipment list / SOE of Carts , the points Highlighted in Colour are in Interior vendors scope rest all is equipment / SOE . Delivery period immediate . 
 
Aside Sandeep -    Kindly look into the request of Mr. Manish to  Provide the Authorize suppliers details and contact no . 
 
 
       You raised a query I believe to solve it fully , rather than keeping it hanging , it’s not just co-ordinaƟng with one person there is Designer , Contractor , BOQ VerificaƟon to your query everybody has to be aligned  all these works have to be co-
ordinated  in Mondays busy schedule of those people , nothing is dumped . 
 
 
Regards 
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Santosh TAMBE  
 
       
 

From: Manish Mulchandani <Manish.Mulchandani@adani.com>  
Sent: 09 October 2023 15:16 
To: Santosh Tambe <santosh.tambe@travelfoodservices.com>; Akshay Sharma <akshay.sharma@semolinakitchens.com> 
Cc: Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Rupali Pol <rupali.pol@travelfoodservices.com>; Suraj Kumbhar <suraj.kumbhar@travelfoodservices.com>; Trupti Dalvi <trupti.dalvi@travelfoodservices.com>; Nimisha Jadhav 
<nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>; Prakash Mistry <prakash.mistry@travelfoodservices.com>; Khushbu Verma <khushbu.dayal@travelfoodservices.com>; Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>; Sandeep Bhat <sandeep.bhat@k-corp.in>; 
Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>; Stephen P <stephen.p@k-corp.in>; Kamal Saraf <kamal.saraf@k-corp.in>; Ansari Faheem Noor Hasan <faheem.ansari@travelfoodservices.com>; Saeed Khan <saeed.khan@travelfoodservices.com>; 
Ameet Koomar <Ameet.Koomar@adani.com>; Chirag Shah <Chirag.Shah1@adani.com>; Awadhesh Kumar <Awadhesh.Kumar1@adani.com>; Neha Bagrecha <Neha.Bagrecha@adani.com>; Prathamesh Bhavsar <Prathamesh.Bhavsar@adani.com>; Ajit 
Yadav <ajit.yadav@travelfoodservices.com>; Avadhesh Kumar Singh <Avadhesh.Kumar@adani.com> 
Subject: RE: AMD T1 FF II 02 Nos. Temporary Food truck Earmarked layout with MEP requirements at Wagamama Area Unit: L-38,39  
 
CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe. 

 
Dear Santosh 
 
In line with our today’s telephonic conversation, we raised some queries about carpentry units requirements which you captured in the Equipment’s BOQ of Mexican and Middle Eastern cart. 
 
Now, as per our telephonic conversation, you stated that you are checking the BOQ once again for any duplication of similar works with other packages and will confirm us back. Please be informed that, meanwhile, we are putting this requirement on hold until you share us your 
final equipment requirement along with expected delivery period and list of authorized suppliers with their contact details for the same. 
 
@Akshay Sharma – Requesting your intervention on same since, considering the urgency in all such requirements, the practice of dumping BOQ to TC team with irregularities are getting common which will delay the process.. 
 
Regards, 
Manish Mulchandani 
 

From: Avadhesh Kumar Singh <Avadhesh.Kumar@adani.com>  
Sent: Monday, October 9, 2023 10:57 AM 
To: Manish Mulchandani <Manish.Mulchandani@adani.com> 
Cc: Utkarsh Singh <Utkarsh.Singh@adani.com>; Santosh Tambe <santosh.tambe@travelfoodservices.com>; Rupali Pol <rupali.pol@travelfoodservices.com> 
Subject: FW: AMD T1 FF II 02 Nos. Temporary Food truck Earmarked layout with MEP requirements at Wagamama Area Unit: L-38,39  
 
 
Hi Santosh 
Plz note that all mails to me  must have Manish and Utkarsh in cc else that particular work may be mossed for further process at our end. 
Thanks & Regards 
Avadhesh Kr Singh 
 
 

From: Santosh Tambe <santosh.tambe@travelfoodservices.com>  
Sent: Saturday, October 7, 2023 6:47 PM 
To: Avadhesh Kumar Singh <Avadhesh.Kumar@adani.com> 
Cc: Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Rupali Pol <rupali.pol@travelfoodservices.com>; Suraj Kumbhar <suraj.kumbhar@travelfoodservices.com>; Trupti Dalvi <trupti.dalvi@travelfoodservices.com>; Nimisha Jadhav 
<nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>; Prakash Mistry <prakash.mistry@travelfoodservices.com>; Khushbu Verma <khushbu.dayal@travelfoodservices.com>; Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>; Sandeep Bhat <sandeep.bhat@k-corp.in>; 
Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>; Stephen P <stephen.p@k-corp.in>; Kamal Saraf <kamal.saraf@k-corp.in>; Ansari Faheem Noor Hasan <faheem.ansari@travelfoodservices.com>; Saeed Khan <saeed.khan@travelfoodservices.com>; 
Akshay Sharma <akshay.sharma@semolinakitchens.com>; Ameet Koomar <Ameet.Koomar@adani.com>; Chirag Shah <Chirag.Shah1@adani.com>; Awadhesh Kumar <Awadhesh.Kumar1@adani.com>; Neha Bagrecha <Neha.Bagrecha@adani.com>; 
Prathamesh Bhavsar <Prathamesh.Bhavsar@adani.com>; Ajit Yadav <ajit.yadav@travelfoodservices.com> 
Subject: FW: AMD T1 FF II 02 Nos. Temporary Food truck Earmarked layout with MEP requirements at Wagamama Area Unit: L-38,39  
 
*CAUTION: This mail has originated from outside Adani. Please exercise caution with links and attachments.* 

 
Dear Avadhesh ji , 
 
 
        Please find aƩached the Equipment List of Shawarma  Cart for Ahmedabad T1 SHA at First Floor , Request you to kind do the needful for equipment vendor finalizaƟon and provide the vendors approval  in the below excel format as per the process 
designed by Ameet Koomar ji . 
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Vendor Name 
 Final NegoƟated 

Amount 
 Tax  

 Final  NegoƟated 
Amount with Taxes 

 Outlet   Remark 

                   
 
Your support solicited  
 
 
Regards 
Santosh TAMBE  
From: Santosh Tambe  

 

From: Santosh Tambe  
Sent: 06 October 2023 18:37 
To: 'Awadhesh Kumar' <Awadhesh.Kumar1@adani.com> 
Cc: Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Rupali Pol <rupali.pol@travelfoodservices.com>; Suraj Kumbhar <suraj.kumbhar@travelfoodservices.com>; Trupti Dalvi <trupti.dalvi@travelfoodservices.com>; Nimisha Jadhav 
<nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>; Prakash Mistry <prakash.mistry@travelfoodservices.com>; Khushbu Verma <khushbu.dayal@travelfoodservices.com>; Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>; Sandeep Bhat <sandeep.bhat@k-corp.in>; 
Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>; Stephen P <stephen.p@k-corp.in>; Kamal Saraf <kamal.saraf@k-corp.in>; Ansari Faheem Noor Hasan <faheem.ansari@travelfoodservices.com>; Saeed Khan <saeed.khan@travelfoodservices.com>; 
Akshay Sharma <akshay.sharma@semolinakitchens.com>; 'Ameet Koomar' <Ameet.Koomar@adani.com>; 'Chirag Shah' <Chirag.Shah1@adani.com>; 'Awadhesh Kumar' <Awadhesh.Kumar1@adani.com>; Neha Bagrecha <Neha.Bagrecha@adani.com>; 
Prathamesh Bhavsar <Prathamesh.Bhavsar@adani.com> 
Subject: FW: AMD T1 FF II 02 Nos. Temporary Food truck Earmarked layout with MEP requirements at Wagamama Area Unit: L-38,39  
 
Dear Awadhesh , 
 
      Please find aƩached the Details of the shawarma Cart  at T1 SHA L 38/39 locaƟon , your kind approval solicited on the same .Details of equipment list and load sheet aƩached for your kind perusal . 
 
 
 
Regards 
Santosh TAMBE  
 

From: Saeed Khan <saeed.khan@travelfoodservices.com>  
Sent: 06 October 2023 16:21 
To: Santosh Tambe <santosh.tambe@travelfoodservices.com> 
Cc: Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Akshay Sharma <akshay.sharma@semolinakitchens.com>; Rupali Pol <rupali.pol@travelfoodservices.com>; Suraj Kumbhar <suraj.kumbhar@travelfoodservices.com>; Nimisha Jadhav 
<nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>; Trupti Dalvi <trupti.dalvi@travelfoodservices.com>; Ansari Faheem Noor Hasan <faheem.ansari@travelfoodservices.com>; Prakash Mistry <prakash.mistry@travelfoodservices.com>; Khushbu Verma 
<khushbu.dayal@travelfoodservices.com> 
Subject: RE: AMD T1 FF II 02 Nos. Temporary Food truck Earmarked layout with MEP requirements at Wagamama Area Unit: L-38,39  
 
Dear Santosh, 
 
Please find aƩached Mexican Cart GFC docket for your reference.  
 
AƩached List: 

1) Equipment Schedule, 
2) Service Layouts In Cad & PDFs. 

 
Regards,  
Saeed Khan 
 

From: Santosh Tambe <santosh.tambe@travelfoodservices.com>  
Sent: 04 October 2023 18:12 
To: Saeed Khan <saeed.khan@travelfoodservices.com>; Ansari Faheem Noor Hasan <faheem.ansari@travelfoodservices.com> 
Cc: Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Akshay Sharma <akshay.sharma@semolinakitchens.com>; Rupali Pol <rupali.pol@travelfoodservices.com>; Suraj Kumbhar <suraj.kumbhar@travelfoodservices.com>; Nimisha Jadhav 
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<nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>; Trupti Dalvi <trupti.dalvi@travelfoodservices.com>; Prakash Mistry <prakash.mistry@travelfoodservices.com>; Khushbu Verma <khushbu.dayal@travelfoodservices.com> 
Subject: FW: AMD T1 FF II 02 Nos. Temporary Food truck Earmarked layout with MEP requirements at Wagamama Area Unit: L-38,39  
 
 
Dear Saeed , 
 
     As discussed we need to provide the details to ADANI Ahmbd by tomorrow 2nd  half , your support solicited . 
 
 
 
Regards 
Santosh TAMBE  

From: Santosh Tambe  
Sent: 03 October 2023 12:08 
To: Awadhesh Kumar <Awadhesh.Kumar1@adani.com> 
Cc: Chirag Shah <Chirag.Shah1@adani.com>; Atul Panse <Atul.Panse@adani.com>; Siddharth Gujarathi <Siddharth.Gujarathi@adani.com>; Akshay Sharma <akshay.sharma@semolinakitchens.com>; Avadhut Kurnekar <Avadhut.Kurnekar@Adani.com>; 
Himanshi Chaudhary <Himanshi.Chaudhary@adani.com>; Rupali Pol <rupali.pol@travelfoodservices.com>; Prathamesh Bhavsar <Prathamesh.Bhavsar@adani.com>; Neha Bagrecha <Neha.Bagrecha@adani.com>; Prakash Mistry 
<prakash.mistry@travelfoodservices.com>; Atul Panse <Atul.Panse@adani.com> 
Subject: RE: AMD T1 FF II 02 Nos. Temporary Food truck Earmarked layout with MEP requirements at Wagamama Area Unit: L-38,39  
 
Dear Awadhesh , 
 
        Designer is working on it , will  provide you immediately as it is ready . 
 
 
Regards 
Santosh TAMBE   
 

From: Awadhesh Kumar <Awadhesh.Kumar1@adani.com>  
Sent: 03 October 2023 11:52 
To: Santosh Tambe <santosh.tambe@travelfoodservices.com> 
Cc: Chirag Shah <Chirag.Shah1@adani.com>; Atul Panse <Atul.Panse@adani.com>; Siddharth Gujarathi <Siddharth.Gujarathi@adani.com>; Akshay Sharma <akshay.sharma@semolinakitchens.com>; Avadhut Kurnekar <Avadhut.Kurnekar@Adani.com>; 
Himanshi Chaudhary <Himanshi.Chaudhary@adani.com>; Rupali Pol <rupali.pol@travelfoodservices.com>; Prathamesh Bhavsar <Prathamesh.Bhavsar@adani.com>; Neha Bagrecha <Neha.Bagrecha@adani.com>; Prakash Mistry 
<prakash.mistry@travelfoodservices.com>; Atul Panse <Atul.Panse@adani.com> 
Subject: RE: AMD T1 FF II 02 Nos. Temporary Food truck Earmarked layout with MEP requirements at Wagamama Area Unit: L-38,39  
 
CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.z 
Urgent Reminder! 
 
Dear Santosh, 
Still awaited earmarked layout of carts and it’s MEP requirements. Please note there would be required some time to get the MEP provision done at site by our projects team. 
 
Hence share the details by EOD today. 
 
Thanks 
Awadhesh 
 
 
 
 

From: Awadhesh Kumar  
Sent: Friday, September 15, 2023 12:35 PM 
To: santosh.tambe <santosh.tambe@travelfoodservices.com> 
Cc: Chirag Shah <Chirag.Shah1@adani.com>; Atul Panse <Atul.Panse@adani.com>; Siddharth Gujarathi <Siddharth.Gujarathi@adani.com>; Akshay Sharma <akshay.sharma@semolinakitchens.com>; Avadhut Kurnekar <Avadhut.Kurnekar@Adani.com>; 
Himanshi Chaudhary <Himanshi.Chaudhary@adani.com>; Rupali Pol <rupali.pol@travelfoodservices.com>; Prathamesh Bhavsar <Prathamesh.Bhavsar@adani.com>; Neha Bagrecha <Neha.Bagrecha@adani.com>; prakash.mistry 
<prakash.mistry@travelfoodservices.com> 
Subject: AMD T1 FF II 02 Nos. Temporary Food truck Earmarked layout with MEP requirements at Wagamama Area Unit: L-38,39  
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Dear Santosh, 
As discussed please share the earmarked layout with MEP requirements for 02 Nos. Temporary Food Truck which are going to be placed at Wagamama area.  
 

 
Best Regards, 
Awadhesh Kumar 
Lead-Commercial Development 
Adani Airport Holdings Limited 
Commerce House-6, 6th Floor,Prahlad Nagar  
Ahmedabad-380051, Mob: +916358914153 
Email: awadhesh.kumar1@adani.com 
 

 
 
 
DISCLAIMER: The information contained in this electronic message and any other attachment to this message are intended solely for the addressee and may contain information that is confidential, privileged and exempt from disclosure under applicable law. If you are not the 
intended recipient, you are hereby formally notified that any use, copying or distribution of this e-mail, in whole or in part, is strictly prohibited. Please immediately notify the sender by return e-mail and delete all copies of this e-mail and any attachments from your system. Any 
views or opinions presented in this email are solely those of the author and do not necessarily represent those of the company.  
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intended recipient, you are hereby formally notified that any use, copying or distribution of this e-mail, in whole or in part, is strictly prohibited. Please immediately notify the sender by return e-mail and delete all copies of this e-mail and any attachments from your system. Any 
views or opinions presented in this email are solely those of the author and do not necessarily represent those of the company.  
 
WARNING: Computer viruses can be transmitted via email. The recipient should check this email and any attachments for the presence of viruses. Adani Group accepts no liability for any damage caused by any virus transmitted by this email.  
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