Ramendra Singh

From: VIKAT VINAYAK <infovikatvinayak18@gmail.com>
Sent: 25 April 2024 16:04

To: Abdul Rehman

Cc: Sandeep Bhat; Ramendra Singh

Subject: Re: Request for Loading & Unloading quotation
Attachments: Loading & Unloading.pdf

You don't often get email from infovikatvinayak18@gmail.com. Learn why this is important

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize
the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Sir

Please find Revised PI for Loading & Unloading work for Delhi Budweiser Bar.

Best Regards

Jitendra Tiwari

Business Head

For VIKAT VINAYAK18 SERVICES PRIVATE LIMITED

+91 9871323798
: infovikatvinayak1l8@gmail.com
: www.vikatvinayak18.com

On Thu, Apr 25, 2024 at 3:36 PM Abdul Rehman <abdul.rehman@k-corp.in> wrote:

Dear Vinayak Ji,

The given costing seems to be too high. Target price for the same is RS 35000.

Please share your no regret price.

Thanks & Regards,
Abdul Rehman
B | & +919920292129

Travel Food Services Pvt. Limited.



From: VIKAT VINAYAK <infovikatvinayak18 @gmail.com>

Sent: 25 April 2024 15:12

To: Ramendra Singh <ramendra.singh@semolinakitchens.com>

Cc: Sandeep Bhat <sandeep.bhat@k-corp.in>; Abdul Rehman <abdul.rehman@k-corp.in>
Subject: Re: Request for Loading & Unloading quotation

Dear Sir,

Please find PI for Loading & Unloading work for Delhi Budweiser Bar.

Best Regards

Jitendra Tiwari

Business Head

For VIKAT VINAYAK18 SERVICE PRIVATE LIMITED

+91 9871323798
: infovikatvinayak1l8@gmail.com
: www.vikatvinayak18.com




