Mrunal Joshi

From: Rasika Pawar <swaminientp0909@gmail.com>

Sent: 26 September 2024 20:48

To: Mrunal Joshi

Cc: prabhakar.sawant; Shashank Mahadik; Conrad Alves; Binu Balachandran; Royston
Netto

Subject: Re: Quote - Plumbing work

Dear Sir,

Noted with Thanks!!

We will ensure to complete this activity by Sunday evening.

Thanks and Regards,
Swamini Entp

On Thu, Sep 26, 2024 at 5:41 PM Mrunal Joshi <mrunal.joshi@k-corp.in> wrote:

Hi Mr. Alpesh,

We are working on the PO as per the quotation is received.

We suggest you that please do not wait for the approved PO to start and complete the work, as we need to have
this work to be done by upcoming weekend only.

Starting from tomorrow night and completed by the Sunday evening.

Also, the payment will be released within 7-10 working days post work completion and Invoice submission.

Kindly acknowledge the same here.

Thank you.

Regards,

Mrunal.

From: Rasika Pawar <swaminientp0909@gmail.com>
Sent: 26 September 2024 14:43




To: Mrunal Joshi <mrunal.joshi@k-corp.in>; Royston Netto <mumbai.admin@copperchimney.in>
Subject: Quote - Plumbing work

Dear Sir,

PFA....Quote for Waterproofing and plumbing work

Regards,

Swamini Entp



