Ramendra Singh

From: Saurav Pillai <saurav.pillai@copperchimney.in>

Sent: 27 August 2024 11:11

To: Ramendra Singh

Cc: Shashikant Vishwakarma; Amol Punde

Subject: RE: Qtn required for S.S. Tandoor

Attachments: PurchaseOrderPrint45444364-a50b-4979-81e1-f8b369d94c4a.pdf; RE: Requesting Approval for flexible hose to convert tandoor

on PNG gas at CC Worli store.

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Ramendra ji,

We need to close with Raj tandoor only (SVD) as we have previously raised PO for 3 tandoors for R-City but now requirement has been reworked to 2 Tandoors.
So, the PO is to be amended and the separate PR was raised for CC Worli where there is requirement of 1 PNG tandoor.

All the necessary approvals are attached in the mails.
Please confirm and raise the PO in name of Raj Tandoor.

Regard,
Saurav

From: raj tandoor <rajtandoors@yahoo.co.in>

Sent: Monday, August 26, 2024 3:38 PM

To: Ramendra Singh <ramendra.singh@semolinakitchens.com>

Cc: Shashikant Vishwakarma <shashikant.vishwakarma@k-corp.in>; Saurav Pillai <saurav.pillai@copperchimney.in>
Subject: Re: Qtn required for S.S. Tandoor

Dear Mr Ramendra,
Please find attached revised proforma invoice for your reference.

Regards,
Dhruv Narula



On Monday 26 August, 2024 at 12:01:18 pm IST, raj tandoor <rajtandoors@yahoo.co.in> wrote:

Dear Mr Ramendra,
Please find attached the quotation for your reference.

Regards,
Dhruv Narula

9920778002
On Monday 26 August, 2024 at 10:23:47 am IST, Ramendra Singh <ramendra.singh@semolinakitchens.com> wrote:

Dear Partners,

Kindly share the below items qgtn

S.S.Tandoor on Wheels (PNG Operated) — 850 x 850 x 1000 —Qty-1

Delivery address: CC Maharashtra Worli
\

Thanks & Regards,

Ramendra Singh

9999118677



