Ramendra Singh

From: nietco . <nietco@hotmail.com>

Sent: 18 November 2024 15:42

To: Ramendra Singh

Cc: Sandeep Bhat K-Corp; shashikant.vishwakarma@k-corp.in
Subject: Fw: Qtn required for Pasta Makers - - Imperia - Restaurant

You don't often get email from nietco@hotmail.com. Learn why this is important

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the
sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Sir,

Greetings from NEW INDIA !!

We are pleased to offer as follows;

1 IMPERIA Restaurant Manual Roller Machine Rs. 50,000/- each
TERMS & CONDITIONS :

GST : 18% extra

FREIGHT: Extra as applicable

DELIVERY: Ex-stock, till stocks last

PAYMENT : 100% ADVANCE.

Installation : Extra

VALIDITY : QUOTE VALID FOR 15 DAYS THERE AFTER SUBJECT TO OUR CONFIRMATION.

HSN 8438

Warm Regards,

Prakash Vaswani
Director

The New India Electric & Trading Co.

. +91-22-22651177 | +919833411770
info@pastamachine.in




I www.pastamachine.in
38 Ambalal Doshi Marg, Hamam House, Fort, Mumbai — 400 023

£

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Ramendra Singh <ramendra.singh@semolinakitchens.com>

Date: Mon, Nov 18, 2024 at 3:34 PM

Subject: Qtn required for Pasta Makers - - Imperia - Restaurant

To: nietco@gmail.com <nietco@gmail.com>

Cc: Sandeep Bhat K-Corp <sandeep.bhat@k-corp.in>, Shashikant Vishwakarma <shashikant.vishwakarma@k-

corp.in>

Dear Partners,

Kindly share the below item qtn

Item Qty
Pasta Makers - - Imperia -
Restaurant 1.00

Thanks & Regards,

Ramendra Singh

9999118677

From: NIETCO - Pastamachine.in <nietco@gmail.com>

Sent: 18 November 2024 15:38

To: nietco . <nietco@hotmail.com>

Subject: Fwd: Qtn required for Pasta Makers - - Imperia - Restaurant

Warm Regards,



Prakash Vaswani
Director

The New India Electric & Trading Co.

+91-22-22651177 | +919833411770
info@pastamachine.in

I www.pastamachine.in
38 Ambalal Doshi Marg, Hamam House, Fort, Mumbai — 400 023

£

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Ramendra Singh <ramendra.singh@semolinakitchens.com>

Date: Mon, Nov 18, 2024 at 3:34 PM

Subject: Qtn required for Pasta Makers - - Imperia - Restaurant

To: nietco@gmail.com <nietco@gmail.com>

Cc: Sandeep Bhat K-Corp <sandeep.bhat@k-corp.in>, Shashikant Vishwakarma <shashikant.vishwakarma@k-

corp.in>

Dear Partners,

Kindly share the below item qtn

Item Qty

Pasta Makers - - Imperia -

Restaurant 1.00

Thanks & Regards,
Ramendra Singh
9999118677






