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Swapnil Sutar

From: THE HOSPITALITY SOLUTION <thehospitalitysolution@gmail.com>
Sent: 15 June 2024 13:39
To: Swapnil Sutar
Cc: Sandeep Bhat; Abdul Rehman
Subject: Re: Need quote - Spare parts 141

Dear Swapnil, 
 
As per the details for spare received from your site and had the discussion with your maintenance team of Mumbai airport. 
Here I am sharing our quote for the local spares. 
 

1)      2 Way Rotary Switch  15amp                                 Rs. 950/- x 02 nos     = 1,900/- 
2)      Thermostat 300c                                                      Rs. 650/- x04.nos      = 2,600/-                                  
3)      indicator bulb                                                            Rs. 95/-  x10 nos       = 950/- 
4)      2.5 sq mm  3 core flexible cable                             Rs. 275/-x10 meters = 2,750/- 
5)      2.5 cable sq mm heat proof single wire                Rs.172/- x10 meters = 1,720/-  
6)      Griller Coil                                                                   Rs. 2,700/- x03nos =   8,100/- 
7)      Deep fryer coil                                                            Rs. 3,250/-x 02nos =   6,500/- 
8)      Fryer Basket SS                                                            Rs. 1,950/-x02nos =  3,900/- 
 
9) GST@18% extra. 
 
Kindly go through the above quote and let us know your valuable feedback. 
Assuring you of our best services at all times. 
M/s. The Hospitality Solution. 
 
Thanks & Regards 
 
A. khan 
(Sr. service engg) 
 
NOTE: 
i) PO AND PAYMENT SHOULD BE ON THE NAME OF M/s. THE HOSPITALITY SOLUTION. 
ii) 100% ADVANCE PAYMENT. 
iii) DELIVERY TIME AT LEAST 2-3 WORKING DAYS AFTER PO AND PAYMENT. 
iv) HSN CODE - 8419 
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On Thu, Jun 13, 2024 at 1:39 PM Swapnil Sutar <swapnil.sutar@k-corp.in> wrote: 

Dear Sir, 

  

As Discussed , Please share the quote for below equipments. 

1)      2 Way Rotary Switch  2.00 

2)      Thermostat 4.00 

3)      indicator bulb 10.00 

4)      2.5 sq mm  3 core cable 10.00 

5)      2.5 cable sq mm heat proof wire 10.00 

6)      Griller Coil 3.00 

7)      Deep fryer coil 2.00 

8)      Fryer Basket 2.00 

9)      Fryer pan 2.00 

  

  

Thanks & Regards, 
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Swapnil Sutar 

📱 | ☎  +91 9987022136 

Travel Food Services Pvt. Limited. 

  

 
 
 
--  

M/s.THE HOSPITALITY SOLUTION. 
  

204,Galaxy Avenue, Nr.Cosmos Bldg, 
Marol Maroshi Road, Marol, 

Andheri(e), Mumbai-400 059. 
  

Mobile - 09819104761. 


