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Mrunal Joshi

From: Dayspring Enterprises <projects@dayspringent.com>
Sent: 01 January 2025 17:04
To: Mrunal Joshi; dayspringent@gmail.com
Cc: Manisha Bakde; Stephen P; Lovejot Sekhon; Ashish Nagar; Shama Nair; Suraj Kumbhar; 

Ameet.Koomar; Akshay Sharma; Prakash Mistry; Anita Verma; Pushpak Shewale
Subject: Re: Termination PO (Semolina/PO/24-25/001403) Due to Discrepancies- Chaayos 

Mumbai T2 
Attachments: DE NO regret offer Chaayos Mumbai T2 - Dayspring.xlsx

Dear Sir, 
 
PFA the final quote for chayos T2 for your kind purusal. As discussed kindly process the new PO so that we start the 
work 03-Jan 2025 onwards 
 
With regards 
 
Thanks & Regards 
Team Projects 
Mobile  :               +91-9215151597 
Whatsapp:          +91-9372476631 
Email: projects@dayspringent.com 
Website: www.dayspringent.com 
--  
Dayspring Enterprises 
1601 Happy Home Apts, Sai Baba Nagar, 
Boriwali(West), Mumbai-400090, 
Maharashtra 
 
 

From: Dayspring Enterprises <projects@dayspringent.com> 
Date: Tuesday, 31 December 2024 at 11:49 AM 
To: Mrunal Joshi <mrunal.joshi@k-corp.in>, dayspringent@gmail.com <dayspringent@gmail.com> 
Cc: Manisha Bakde <manisha.bakde@semolinakitchens.com>, Stephen P <stephen.p@k-corp.in>, Lovejot 
Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>, Ashish Nagar <ashish.nagar@travelfoodservices.com>, Shama Nair 
<shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>, Suraj Kumbhar <suraj.kumbhar@travelfoodservices.com>, 
Ameet.Koomar <ameet.koomar@adani.com>, Akshay Sharma <akshay.sharma@semolinakitchens.com>, 
Prakash Mistry <prakash.mistry@travelfoodservices.com>, Anita Verma 
<anita.verma@semolinakitchens.com>, Pushpak Shewale <pushpak.shewale@k-corp.in> 
Subject: Re: Termination PO (Semolina/PO/24-25/001403) Due to Discrepancies- Chaayos Mumbai T2  

Dear sir  
 
We regret the delay , will share the same by today .  
 
With regards  
 
Get Outlook for Android 
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From: Mrunal Joshi <mrunal.joshi@k-corp.in> 
Sent: Monday, December 30, 2024 6:10:11 PM 
To: Dayspring Enterprises <projects@dayspringent.com>; dayspringent@gmail.com <dayspringent@gmail.com> 
Cc: Manisha Bakde <manisha.bakde@semolinakitchens.com>; Stephen P <stephen.p@k-corp.in>; Lovejot Sekhon 
<lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>; Ashish Nagar <ashish.nagar@travelfoodservices.com>; Shama Nair 
<shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Suraj Kumbhar <suraj.kumbhar@travelfoodservices.com>; Ameet.Koomar 
<ameet.koomar@adani.com>; Akshay Sharma <akshay.sharma@semolinakitchens.com>; Prakash Mistry 
<prakash.mistry@travelfoodservices.com>; Anita Verma <anita.verma@semolinakitchens.com>; Pushpak Shewale 
<pushpak.shewale@k-corp.in> 
Subject: RE: Termination PO (Semolina/PO/24-25/001403) Due to Discrepancies- Chaayos Mumbai T2  
 
Dear Raj ji, 
  
As we discussed and agreed, please share with us the revised priced BOQ as per the reverse auction amount of Rs. 
10,86,125/- to proceed with the order. 
Thank you. 
  
  
Regards, 
Mrunal. 
  

From: Dayspring Enterprises <projects@dayspringent.com>  
Sent: 27 December 2024 19:36 
To: Mrunal Joshi <mrunal.joshi@k-corp.in>; dayspringent@gmail.com 
Cc: Manisha Bakde <manisha.bakde@semolinakitchens.com>; Stephen P <stephen.p@k-corp.in>; Lovejot Sekhon 
<lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>; Ashish Nagar <ashish.nagar@travelfoodservices.com>; Shama Nair 
<shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Suraj Kumbhar <suraj.kumbhar@travelfoodservices.com>; Ameet.Koomar 
<ameet.koomar@adani.com>; Akshay Sharma <akshay.sharma@semolinakitchens.com>; Prakash Mistry 
<prakash.mistry@travelfoodservices.com>; Anita Verma <anita.verma@semolinakitchens.com>; Pushpak Shewale 
<pushpak.shewale@k-corp.in> 
Subject: Re: Termination PO (Semolina/PO/24-25/001403) Due to Discrepancies- Chaayos Mumbai T2  
  
Dear sir, 
  
Since we had completed Barricading PO for T2 and scope of work opened for execution and also as per direction of 
Projects we had already started Fabrication work and Carpentory work. 
  
We request you for consideration for same as we directed to initiate and complete work on high priority and escalated 
pace . 
  
We are holding work for today but material procurement already done atvour end for fabrication and carpentory work  
  
With regards  
  
  
  
Thanks & Regards 
Team Projects 
Mobile  :               +91-9215151597 
Whatsapp:          +91-9372476631 
Email: projects@dayspringent.com 
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Website: www.dayspringent.com 
--  
Dayspring Enterprises 
1601 Happy Home Apts, Sai Baba Nagar, 
Boriwali(West), Mumbai-400090, 
Maharashtra 
  
  

From: Mrunal Joshi <mrunal.joshi@k-corp.in> 
Date: Friday, 27 December 2024 at 1:07 PM 
To: Dayspring Enterprises <projects@dayspringent.com>, dayspringent@gmail.com 
<dayspringent@gmail.com> 
Cc: Manisha Bakde <manisha.bakde@semolinakitchens.com>, Stephen P <stephen.p@k-corp.in>, Lovejot 
Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>, Ashish Nagar <ashish.nagar@travelfoodservices.com>, Shama Nair 
<shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>, Suraj Kumbhar <suraj.kumbhar@travelfoodservices.com>, 
Ameet.Koomar <ameet.koomar@adani.com>, Akshay Sharma <akshay.sharma@semolinakitchens.com>, 
Prakash Mistry <prakash.mistry@travelfoodservices.com>, Anita Verma 
<anita.verma@semolinakitchens.com>, Pushpak Shewale <pushpak.shewale@k-corp.in> 
Subject: Termination PO (Semolina/PO/24-25/001403) Due to Discrepancies- Chaayos Mumbai T2  

Dear Team Dayspring, 

Following our recent telephonic discussions, we have reviewed the attached Purchase Order (PO) for the 
interior works at Chaayos, Mumbai T2.  

The rates captured post the round of reverse auction (negotiation) are incorrect, specifically, rates of some items 
(Main Cable & Few Other Miscellaneous items) have been listed with a rate of 0.  

This issue will led to the inclusion of additional items which is part of the original BOQ. 

Due to this issue, we are left with no option but to terminate the PO with immediate effect. Kindly consider the 
PO (Semolina/PO/24-25/001403) as terminated. 

However, we request that you initiate the refund of the advance amount which has been already released 
against this PO. 

  
  
Regards, 
Mrunal. 
 


