
SNo Item Code HSN\SAC Code Item Description UOM Unit Cost Qty GST% VAT % Excise

Total Tax 
Amount
(ININR)

Total Amount
(ININR)

1 FA001026 84388090 Pradeep Coffee Machine-5lit- 111600 13,500.00 1 18.00 0.00 0 13500.00
2 FA001027 84388090 Pradeep Machine 111612 16,290.00 1 18.00 0.00 0 16290.00
3 FA001028 84388090 Pradeep Machine 111612 16,290.00 1 18.00 0.00 0 16290.00
4 FA001029 84388090 Pradeep Machine 111612 16,290.00 1 18.00 0.00 0 16290.00
5 401132 Invoice Rounding 0.40 1 0.00 0.00 0 0.40

Total Unit 5.00 Total INR 62,370.40
Excise Amount 0.00
SGST Amount 11,226.60

a) Delivery schedule to be taken from the Buyer before 
Despatching the mater

b) PLEASE SEND THE ORIGINAL COMMERCIAL/GST 
INVOICE ALONG WITH THE MATERIAL TO THE DELIVERY 
ADDRESS.

Charges Amount 0.00

Total INR Incl. Taxes 73,596.60

Terms:-
Payment terms: 100% Advance along with GST

Freight: Inland Freight will be extra at actuals

Installation: Installation extra

Warranty: 12 Months Warranty

Delivery Timeline: 5 to 6 days from approved PO.

Unloading at Site: In GMR Scope

Outlet Name :HYD FF 26 ISHA Bulb Chai Point

Page No: 1

Vendor No. V0000125 Purchase Order
Order Number PO/23-24/CAP/10009

Page No: 112-03-2024  17:17:47HARMONY INTERNATIONAL302, SATYAM CHS, MAROLI CHURCH, MAHUL ROADCHEMBUR, MUMBAIMUMBAI, 400074India
Shipped Location
Head OfficeTelangana, 500108INIndia

Invoice LocationHead Office
500108ININ

Gmr Hospitality LimitedGMR Aero Towers,5th FloorShamshabad, Hyderabad, 500108 TelanganaP.A.N. No. AREPA2226M
Contact PersonContact No.
PO Entry DatePayment Terms 06-03-2024

Corporate Address

State Name TelanganaComp GST No. 36AAJCG9402E1ZO
36AAJCG9402E1ZOGSTIN No.

State 36
State Code 27State Name MaharashtraVendor GST No. 27AREPA2226M2ZYVendor Inv. No.
Vendor Phone No. 09823674722/7977271899
Dept. NameVendor Email

Not Approved

Indent NoHO PO No.HO PO DateWeb : www.travelfoodservices.com C.I.N : U55101DL2009PTC196639



Sr No Description
Qty Brand Model Rate Amt Brand Model Rate Amt Brand Model Rate Amt

2 Insulated pasterurizer 12L 1 111612 16,290.00 16290 111612 16,290.00 16290 17104 17104
4 PR  Pasteurizer 5 LTR 1 111600 12860 12860 111600 17286 17286 12860 12860

29150 33576 29964

Harmony international Hotel world Nidhi



                                          HARMONY INTERNATIONAL
                                                 302, Satyam CHS , Maroli Church,
                                                                         Mahul Road ,Chembur East,
                                                                                Mumbai - 400074.

                                                                  TEL:- 09823674722 / 07977271899
                                                                  QUOTATION / PROFORMA INVOICE

CLIENT DETAILS SUPPLIER DETAILS
TRAVEL FOOD SERVICES GST NO           :  27AREPA2226M2ZY
MUMBAI PAN                 :  AREPA2226M

LEGAL NAME : Bharat Hukumchand Agarwal

DATE : 11.03.2024
Sr. ITEM QTY RATE GOODS
No.    IN  DESCRIPTION CODE IMAGE IN PER % AMT % AMT % AMT  TOTAL

NOS PRICE

1 P Kettle 10L 111514 1 35573.00 18.00 0.00 9.00 3201.57 9.00 3201.57 35573.00

2 Insulated pasterurizer 
12L 

111612 1 16290.00 18.00 0.00 9.00 1466.10 9.00 1466.10 16290.00

3 ELECTRIC MILK 
BOILER 20L - 

111620 1 19000.00 18.00 0.00 9.00 1710.00 9.00 1710.00 19000.00

4 PR Pasteurizer 5 LTR 111600 1 12860.00 18.00 0.00 9.00 1157.40 9.00 1157.40 12860.00

5 ELECTRIC MILK 
BOILER 20L - 

111620 1 19000.00 18.00 0.00 9.00 1710.00 9.00 1710.00 19000.00

          GOODS TOTAL 102723.00
1) Payment : 100% advance to confirm orders. IGST 0.00
2) Delivery   : Within 07-15 Days. CGST 9245.07
3) Breakages : covered ex our warehouse / showroom. SGST 9245.07
4) Freight       :  Extra as per actuals TOTAL AMOUNT 121213.14
5) PACKING CHARGES EXTRA. ROUND OFF -0.14

AMOUNT 121213.00

FOR HARMONY INTERNATIONAL

BHARAT AGARWAL - 07977271899 / 09823674722

IGST CGST SGST

TERMS : 
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Swapnil Sutar

From: Bharat Agarwal <bharat@harmonyinternational.co>
Sent: 28 February 2024 20:12
To: Swapnil Sutar
Cc: Sandeep Bhat; Abdul Rehman
Subject: Re: Need quote for Lucknow outlet
Attachments: TRAVEL FOOD SERVICES ..28.02.2024.xlsx

Dear Sir, 
 
Please find attached quotes, 
Regards, 
 
Harmony International 
Bharat Agarwal 
09823674722 / 07977271899 
 
On Wed, 28 Feb 2024 at 11:24, Swapnil Sutar <swapnil.sutar@k-corp.in> wrote: 

HI Partner, 

Please share the quote for Lucknow airport outlets. 

  

Sr No Description  Rate 
1 P Kettle 10L Model no111514   

2 
Insulated pasterurizer 12L Model no 
111612   

3 
ELECTRIC MILK BOILER 20L - 
111503   

4 PR Pasteurizer 5LTR 111503   

5 
ELECTRIC MILK BOILER 20L - 
111503   
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Thanks & Regards, 

  

Swapnil Sutar 

📱 | ☎  +91 9987022136 

Travel Food Services Pvt. Limited. 

  



Sameer's Gift Corner
Mapusa Trade Centre, First Floor Morod Mapusa
Goa 403507
Phone: 0832-2262492, 9673799998
Email: essani@sameersales.net
GST IN: 30AABPE9005G1ZG

 

QUOTATION

Sub Total : 1,08,836.00
State GST : 9,795.25

Central GST : 9,795.25

Round Off : -0.50

 Total: 1,28,426.00 
Total Amount (in words):  Indian Rupees One Lakh Twenty-Eight Thousand Four Hundred and Twenty-Six Only

For Sameer's Gift Corner
Bank Details: HDFC BANK MAPUSA BRANCH A/c;

# IFSC: HDFC0000202;

# A/C No: 02022000002232;

Quotation No. QO/1/8923a
 

Customer Travel Food Services Pvt. Limited.
 

Delivery State Goa

Date. 28 Feb 2024 Contact Swapnil Sutar Phone +91 9987022136

Billing Details
 

Delivery Address

# HSN Code Description GST Qty Rate Amount
1 84198120 111514 TEA BREWER WITH TIMER 10L (111514) 1 nos 18% 1 38,902.50 38,902.50

2 84198120 ELE07 INSULATED PASTEURIZER 12LTR(MODEL NO.111612) 1 nos 18% 1 17,104.75 17,104.75

3 841981 INS15 INSULATED PASTEURIZER 20LTR (M.NO.111620) 1 nos 18% 2 19,984.25 39,968.50

4 84198120 INS19 INSULATED PASTEURIZER (MILK BOILER) 5LTR (M.NO.111600) 1 nos 18% 1 12,860.25 12,860.25

5

6

7

8

9

10

TOTAL QTY: 5.00

Notes:
VALID FOR 8 DAYS
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Swapnil Sutar

From: essani@sameersales.net on behalf of Essani <essani@sameersales.net>
Sent: 28 February 2024 13:31
To: Swapnil Sutar
Cc: nidhi@sameersales.net; shs1 ; Sandeep Bhat; Abdul Rehman
Subject: Re: Need quote for Lucknow outlet
Attachments: Travel-Food-Services-Pvt.-Limited.-QO-1-8923a__28022024_.pdf

Dear Sir 
 
PFA quote for your request. 
 
Regards 
 
VASANTI 
 
From: Nidhi Aeer <nidhi@sameersales.net> 
Sent: Wed, 28 Feb 2024 12:53:55 GMT+0530 
To: "essani " <essani@sameersales.net> 
Subject: Fw: Need quote for Lucknow outlet 
 
Dear Vasanti, 
   Please quote as below 
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From: Swapnil Sutar <swapnil.sutar@k-corp.in> 
Sent: Wed, 28 Feb 2024 11:24:53 GMT+0530 
To: <recipients undisclosed> 
Cc: Sandeep Bhat <sandeep.bhat@k-corp.in>, Abdul Rehman <abdul.rehman@k-corp.in> 
Subject: Need quote for Lucknow outlet 
  

HI Partner, 

Please share the quote for Lucknow airport outlets. 

  

Sr No Description  Rate 
1 P Kettle 10L Model no111514   

2 
Insulated pasterurizer 12L Model no 
111612   

3 
ELECTRIC MILK BOILER 20L - 
111503   

4 PR Pasteurizer 5LTR 111503   
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5 
ELECTRIC MILK BOILER 20L - 
111503   

  

  

Thanks & Regards, 

  

Swapnil Sutar 

📱 | ☎  +91 9987022136 

Travel Food Services Pvt. Limited. 

  



Sr.No. Goods Specifications Qty Rate/Piece GST-% Amount
1 Pasturizer 111312 5   17,286.00 18% 101987.4
2 Milk Boiler 111503 2     7,055.00 18% 16649.8
3 P Kettle 10L 111514 1.00      35,573.00  18% 35573
4 Insulated pasterurizer 12L 111612 1.00      16,290.00  18% 16290

170500.2
-0.2

170500

5150

100% Advance
Inclusive
Exclusive

Perform Invoice No: 
PO/Ref No: 

Payment Ref: 
Packing:
Freight:

* Goods will be delivered within 7 days from the date of ADVANCE payment received

BANK DETAILS
YES BANK Acc No: 008261900000860 IFSC Code: YESB0000082

Amount (in Words) : One Lakh seventy thousand five hundred

Round Off

Performa Invoice

* No Gaurantee & Warantee for Electronic Products
* 6 months Warrantee for SS Products 

Terms & Conditions:

66, Kansara Chawl, Kalbadevi, Mumbai-400002
hotelworld110@gmail.com                    22426564/9821304620

Grand Total

Date: 03-02-2024

Total

GST-27AICPV5848B1Z3
Bill To: Travel Foods Services

Ship To: Travel Foods Services
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Swapnil Sutar

From: Hotel World Steel <info@hotelworldsteel.com>
Sent: 03 February 2024 13:07
To: Sandeep Bhat
Cc: hotel world; Swapnil Sutar; Abdul Rehman; Santosh Sawant
Subject: Re: Pradeep team boilers material urgent Lucknow
Attachments: HW-PI-Sandeep Sir-3rd Jan 24.xlsx

Dear Sir, 
 
PFA 
 
On Sat, Feb 3, 2024 at 1:01 PM Sandeep Bhat <sandeep.bhat@k-corp.in> wrote: 

Dear Niraj  

  

We have urgent requirement for below mentioned items , please quote urgently  

  

 

  

  

  

Thanks & Regards  
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Sandeep Bhat  

Senior Manager Purchase  

Travel foods Services Pvt Ltd 

Shivsagar Estate A-Block , 1st floor 

Dr A.B Road , Worli Mumbai -400018 

Mob : 9821945599 

  

  


