Mrunal Joshi

From: Intercare Enterprises <info.intercareenterprises@gmail.com>
Sent: 21 June 2024 17:25

To: Mrunal Joshi

Cc: Binu Balachandran

Subject: Re: Target Price- ABC Bar Kolkata

Attachments: RO1-Target Price- ABC Bar- KOL- Inter Care Enterprises.xlsx

Dear Mrunalji,
I hope this message finds you well.

Attached, you will find our revised estimate for ABC bar kolkata. Please review the rates and details at your
earliest convenience.

Should you have any questions or need further clarification, please feel free to call me directly.

Thanks & Regards,

Intercare Enterprise
Plot No — 51, Diama Road, Kherwadi,
Bandra (East), Mumbai — 400 051.

Mobile : +91 98209 93221

On Fri, Jun 21, 2024 at 4:39 PM Mrunal Joshi <mrunal.joshi@k-corp.in> wrote:

Dear Sir,

PFA the suggested TFS target prices for the Interior Work required at ABC Bar Kolkata.

Awaiting your revert with No regret price on the same.

Thanks & Regards,
Mr. Mrunal Joshi.

+91 83908 13805



